CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD’'S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Streets and Maintenance
AGENDA DATE: February 16, 2021

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Richard J, Bristol, Director, 915-212-7000
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Director, 915-212-1181

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All
STRATEGIC GOAL: NO. 7: Enhance and Maintain the City’s Infrastructure Network

The linkage to the Strategic Plan is subsection 7.5 — Set one standard for infrastructure across the city.

SUBJECT:

Discussion and actiont on the award of Solicitation 2021-0179, Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Fransmission and
Hydraulic Oils & Fluids to M.J. Mader Enterprises Inc., dba Bio Dyne Chemical Co. for an initial three (3) year term
estimated award of $1,029,278.40. The award also includes a two (2) vear option for an estimated amount of

$686,185.60. The total value of the contract including the initial term plus the option is five (5) years for a total estimated
award of $ 1,715,464.00.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
The approval of this replacement contract would allow for the continual maintenance and upkeep of City owned
vehicles for consistent, safe and efficient operation while maintaining maximum reliability.

SELECTION SUMMARY

The Solicitation was advertised on December 1, 2020 and December 8, 2020. The solicitation was posted on the
City website on December 1, 2020. The email (Purmail} notification was sent out on December 3, 2020. There
were a total of forty-one (41) viewers online; six (6) bids were received; three (3) from local suppliers.

CONTRACT VARIANCE PREVIOUS CONTRACT:
The difference in cost, based on comparison to the previous contract is as follows: An increase of $465,166.11 for
the initial term, which represents an 82.5 % increase, due to increases in pricing and additional quantities.

PROTEST
No protest received for this requirement.

COUNCIL REPRESENTATIVE BRIEFING:
Was a briefing provided? [ ] Yes or [X] No

D Dastrict 1
D District 2
I:| District 3
[ 1 District 4
[ | District 5
[ I District 6
[ District 7
[ District 8
[_] All Districts
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PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
N/A

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Amount: $1,029,278.10
Account No.: 532-37020-531240-3600-P3701
Funding Source Internal Fleet Service Fund

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A
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COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(LOW BID)

****************************************POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW*******************************************
Please place the following item on the REGULAR AGENDA for the Council Meeting of FEBRUARY 16, 2021.

STRATEGIC GOAL: NO. 7 Enhance and Sustain El Paso’s Infrastructure Network

The linkage to the Strategic Plan is subsection 7.5 — Set on standard for infrastructure across the city.
Award Summary:

Discussion and Action on the award of Solicitation No. 2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission
and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids to M.J. Mader Enterprises, Inc. dba Bio Dyne Chemical Co. for an initial three (3) year
term estimated award of $ 1,029,278.40. The award also includes a two (2) year option for an estimated amount of
$ 686,185.60. The total value of the contract including the initial term plus the option is five (5) years for a total
estimated award of $ 1,715,464.00. The award of this contract will allow for the City to perform preventative
maintenance on all vehicles.

Contract Variance:

The difference in cost, based on comparison from previous contract is as follows: An increase of $465.166.11 for
the initial term, which represents an 82.5% increase, due to increases in pricing and additional quantities.

Department: Streets and Maintenance

Award to: M.J. Mader Enterprises, Inc. dba Bio Dyne Chemical Co.
El Paso, TX

Item(s): All

Initial Term: 3 years

Option to Extend: 2 years

Annual Estimated Award: $ 343,092.80

Initial Term Estimated Award: $ 1,029,278.40 (3 years)

Total Estimated Award: $ 1,715,464.00 (5 years)

Account No.: 532-37020-531240-3600-P3701

Funding Source: Internal Fleet Service Fund

District(s): All

This is a Low Bid, unit price contract.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing and Streets and Maintenance Departments recommend award as indicated
to M.J. Mader Enterprises, Inc. dba Bio Dyne Chemical Co., the lowest responsive, responsible bidder, and that
Cummins Inc. and Border International Trucks be deemed non-responsive for failure to bid on all items. In
accordance with this award the City Manager or designee is authorized to exercise future options if needed

******************************************ADDITIONAL INFO BELOW**********************************************



Achievement of

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Crcdlice

In Procurement:

2019 Award Winner

'
ool

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids
BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021

BID NO: 2021-0179
DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance

Brewer Qil Co. C & R Distributing, LLC
Albuquerque, NM El Paso, TX
Bidder 1 of 6 Bidder 2 of 6
GROUP A — ANTIFREEZE, MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS
ESTIMATED | MANUFACTURER UNIT ANNUAL MANUFACTURER / UNIT ANNUAL
ITEM UNIT OF ANNUAL / 3-YR TOTAL 3-YR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL BRAND PRICE TOTAL
NO. MEASURE | QUANTITY BRAND (B) ©) (D) PRODUCT # B) ©) (D)
(A) PRODUCT #
Premix 50/50 2,200 $4.67 $10,274.00 | $30,822.00 | Performance + $5.20 $11,440.00 | $34,320.00
| Antifreeze Yellow| 29 ’ Rugged Gold ' ’ Univ 50/50 ’ ’
Premix 50/50
2 Antifreeze Red / 55 g| 2,090 Zerex ELC $4.71 $9,843.90 $29,531.70 | Performance + HD $5.30 $11,077.00 $33,231.00
. 50/50
Extended Life
15w-40 CK-4
Diesel Puramax
3. . Bulk gl 15,000 Purus SB 15w40 $6.56 $98,400.00 ($295,200.00 15w-40 $6.07 $91,050.00 $273,150.00
Conventional
. Clean Fleet
Motor Oil
15w-40 Low Ash P EGO
4. |Natural Gas Motor| 55 gl 1,100  |purus TFO 15w40|  $9.56 $10,516.00 | $31,548.00 Ur??aﬁo $11.00 $12,100.00 $36,300.00
oil W
SAE 5w-20
5. Conventional 55 gl 4,290 SerPro SB 5w20 $5.75 $24,667.50 | $74,002.50 PureTech $4.55 $19,519.50 $58,558.50
. Syn/Blend 5w-20
Motor Oil
SAE 5w-30
6. Conventional 55 g| 3,660 SerPro SB 5w30 $5.75 $21,045.00 | $63,135.00 PureTech $4.55 $16,653.00 $49,959.00
. Syn/Blend 5w-30
Motor Oil
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Vﬂ@ 2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
DATE: __1/15/2021 Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids Page 1 of 5
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2019 Award Winner 1

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids BID NO: 2021-0179
BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021 DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance
Brewer Qil Co. C & R Distributing, LLC
Albuquerque, NM El Paso, TX
Bidder 1 of 6 Bidder 2 of 6
GROUP A — ANTIFREEZE, MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS
ESTIMATED | MANUFACTURER UNIT ANNUAL MANUFACTURER / UNIT ANNUAL
ITEM UNIT OF ANNUAL / 3-YR TOTAL 3-YR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL BRAND PRICE TOTAL
NO. MEASURE | QUANTITY BRAND (B) ©) (D) PRODUCT # (B) ©) (D)
(A) PRODUCT #
SAE 30 Diesel 110 $7.41 $815.10 $2,445.30 PureMax Fleet $6.75 $742.50 $2,227.50
7. . 55 gl Purus 30w
Supreme Plus Oil 30w
SAE 50 Synthetic
8. Gear / Trans Oil 55 gl 110 Purus FS 50 $16.36 $1,799.60 $5,398.80 |Pure Syn Tran 50w $16.25 $1,787.50 $5,362.50
9. SAE 80-140 55 g| 1,226 Purus Syngear | g2990 | $36,657.40 [$109,972.20 | PureTechSyn $19.25 $23,600.50 | $70,801.50
Synthetic Gear Oil 80w-440 o o Gear 80w-140
Bidder's Price : Bidder's Price:
$36,056.66 $108,169.98
TOTAL GROUP A: (items 1 - 9) $214,018.50 [$642,055.50 $187,970.00 $563,910.00
Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price:
$213,417.76 $640,253.28

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: V"VC 2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
DATE: __1/15/2021 Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids Page 2 of 5
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CITY OF EL PASO Erccllonce
" In Frocurement*
BID TABULATION FORM 2019 Award Winnef
PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids BID NO: 2021-0179
BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021 DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance
Brewer Qil Co. C & R Distributing, LLC
Albuquerque, NM El Paso, TX
Bidder 1 of 6 Bidder 2 of 6

GROUP B — TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC OILS, FLUIDS, AND GREASE

ESTIMATED | MANUFACTURER

TEM UNITOF | ANNUAL p UNIT ANNUAL |, oroms | MANUFACTURER/ UNIT ANNUAL 3.YR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL BRAND PRICE TOTAL
NO. MEASURE | QUANTITY BRAND (B) ) (D) PRODUCT # (B) ©) (D)
(A) PRODUCT #

. Mobile Delvac #1
1. Transynd Oil 554l 1,320 Emgard 2805 $40.44 $53,380.80 ($160,142.40 ATF $34.44 $45,460.80 $136,382.40

LV Multi-Vehicle

Pure Syn
2 Full %54l 1,110 | SerProLVFS | 1100 | $12210.00 |$36,630.00 | Multi-Vehicle $1094 | $12,14340 | $36,430.20
Synthetic ATF
Multi-Vehicle
3. Synthetic 55 gl 1,430 SerProMV SB | $10.03 | $14,342.90 | $43,028.70 M5|ltjit(\e/§r¥i2|e $10.94 $15,644.20 | $46,932.60
Blend ATF
Hydraulic Oil Pura-Tech Hyd
a. Grade Bulk gl 12,050 Purus AW46 $4.48 $53,984.00 |$161,952.00 26w $4.20 $50,610.00 | $151,830.00
ISO 46
Hydraulic Oil
5. Grade 55 gl 220 Purus AW68 $5.57 $1,225.40 | $3,676.20 P“ra'gg\fvh Hyd $4.20 $924.00 $2,772.00
ISO 68
6. | UniversalTractor) 110 PurusPrem THF |  $6.08 $668.80 | $2,006.40 | PuraMaxUTFJ- $6.58 $723.80 $2,171.40

Hydraulic Fluid 20C

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Vﬂd 2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
DATE: __1/15/2021 Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids Page 3 of 5




Achievement of

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids
BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021

In Procurement»

2019 Award Winner

el

BID NO: 2021-0179
DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance

Brewer Qil Co. C & R Distributing, LLC
Albuquerque, NM El Paso, TX
Bidder 1 of 6 Bidder 2 of 6
GROUP B - TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC OILS, FLUIDS, AND GREASE
ESTIMATED | MANUFACTURER UNIT ANNUAL MANUFACTURER / UNIT ANNUAL
ITEM UNITOF | ANNUAL / 3-YR TOTAL 3-YR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL BRAND PRICE TOTAL
NO. MEASURE | QUANTITY BRAND (B) ©) (D) PRODUCT # (B) ©) (D)
(A) PRODUCT #
CITGO HYTHERM
OIL Pura Max Heat
7 | 46 Heat Transfer | 229 330 Rugged HT 46 $8.34 $2,752.20 | $8,256.60 Transfer $7.00 $2,310.00 $6,930.00
oil
8. | HeatTransferOil| 55gl 110 Rugged HT 46 |  $8.34 $917.40 | $2,752.20 P”r_?rg"nas’;e':eat $7.00 $770.00 $2,310.00
9. | UCONSO00Heat j 10,384 UCON 500 $8.37 | $86,914.08 |$260,742.24 | YCONS00Heat | g\0 55 1 9503,624.00 | $1,510,872.00
Transfer Oil Transfer
CP Non-
Conductive Mobil DTE 10
10. Hydraulic Fluid 55gl 220 Purus AW 22 $6.40 $1,408.00 | $4,224.00 Excel 22w $18.00 $3,960.00 $11,880.00
1SO-100
Moly Extreme
Pressure Purus Alletor M Citadel Moly 3% Hi
3,200 2.43 7,776.00 23,328.00 2.99 9,568.00 28,704.00
-1 NL 6l Grade -2 Lbs. 3% ¥ $ $ Temp #2 ¥ ¥ $
Based Grease
TOTAL GROUP B: $235,579.58 |$706,738.74 $645,738.20 | $1,937,214.60
(tems 1 - 11)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ¥ SC
DATE: __1/15/2021

2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids

Page 4 of 5




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids

BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021

Achievement of

In Procurement®

2019 Award Winner

gel

BID NO: 2021-0179
DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance

Brewer Qil Co.
Albuquerque, NM

Bidder 1 of 6

C & R Distributing, LLC
El Paso, TX

Bidder 2 of 6

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY

EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF

THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR
WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THESELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM
OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE
OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE
SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY
MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE
OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF
EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR
TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF
CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

X

]

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within consecutive calendar days 48 2
Within hours or overnight after
. . 6 48
receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency
AMENDMENT ACKNOWLEDGED Yes Yes

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ¥ AC
DATE: __1/15/2021

2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids

Page 5 of 5
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CITY OF EL PASO

&
BID TABULATION FORM

ﬁ)ltncl'rucurement
2019 Award Winner

"
ek

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids BID NO: 2021-0179
BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021 DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance
Cummis Inc. dba Cummins Sales and Service MJ Mader Enterprises, Inc. dba Bio Dyne Chemical Co.
Columbus, OH El Paso, TX
Bidder 3 of 6 Bidder 4 of 6

GROUP A — ANTIFREEZE, MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS

ESTIMATED [ MANUFACTURER UNIT ANNUAL MANUFACTURER/ UNIT ANNUAL

ITEM | pescriprion | UNITOF | ANNUAL ! PRICE TOTAL 3-YR TOTAL BRAND PRICE TOTAL 3-YR TOTAL
NO. MEASURE | QUANTITY BRAND (B) ©) (D) PRODUCT # (B) ©) (D)
(A) PRODUCT #
1. Premix 50/50 55 g| 2,200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Zerex G-0550/50 | $7.65 $16,830.00 | $50,490.00

Antifreeze Yellow

Premix 50/50

2 Antifreeze Red / 55 g| 2,090 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ZeregOI;ISI::)ELC $6.25 $13,062.50 $39,187.50
Extended Life
15w-40 CK-4
Diesel . Citgo Citgard HD
3. Conventional Bulk gl 15,000 |Valvoline VV3850( $8.26 $123,900.00 $371,700.00 15W40 $5.55 $83,250.00 $249,750.00
Motor Oil

15w-40 Low Ash

) 1,100 - $699.90 $769,890.00 | $2,309,670.00 Citgo Citgard $8.75 $9,625.00 $28,875.00
4. |Natural Gas Motor 55 ¢l Valvoline 883935 CNG/LNG 15w40

Qil
SAE 5w-20 . .
5. Conventional 55 gl 4,290 Valvoline VV110 $667.80 $2,864,862.00 | $8,594,586.00 Citgo Milemaster $4.15 $17,803.50 $53,410.50
Motor Oil 5w20
SAE 5w-30 . )
6. Conventional 55 gl 3,660 Valvoline VV172 $667.80 $2,444,148.00 | $7,332,444.00 Citgo Milemaster $4.15 $15,189.00 $45,567.00
Motor Oil Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price: Sw30

$44,742.60 $134,227.80

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

vAaC

APPROVED BY: 2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
DATE: _ 1/15/2021 Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids Page 6 of 15




Achievement of
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ﬁ)ltn Procurement»

2019 Award Winner .
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids
BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021

BID NO: 2021-0179
DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance

Cummis Inc. dba Cummins Sales and Service MJ Mader Enterprises, Inc. dba Bio Dyne Chemical Co.
Columbus, OH El Paso, TX
Bidder 3 of 6 Bidder 4 of 6
GROUP A — ANTIFREEZE, MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS
ESTIMATED| MANUFACTURER UNIT ANNUAL MANUFACTURER / UNIT ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT OF ANNUAL ! PRICE TOTAL 3-YR TOTAL BRAND PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL 3-YR TOTAL
NO. MEASURE || QUANTITY |BRAND PRODUCT (D) (D)
(A) 4 (B) (€) # (B) (€)
SAE 30 Diesel 110 . No Bid No Bid No Bid Citgo Citgard 600 $6.25 $687.50 $2,062.50
7. . 55 gl No Bid
Supreme Plus Oil 30w
g. | SAE S0 Synthetic| . 110 Valvoline ¢4 84905 | $203,417.50 | $610,252.50 Coastal Full $16.00 | $1,760.00 | $5,280.00
Gear / Trans Oil VV70601 o o Synthetic 50w
Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price:
$3,698.50 $11,095.50
9. SAE 80140 | .5, 1,226 Valvoline ¢4 659 50 | $2,034,547.00 | $6,103,641.00 | Citgo Citgear HD | g3 g5 $4,842.70 | $14,528.10
Synthetic Gear Oil VV70045 o o Synthetic 80w140
Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price:
$38,168.50 $114,505.50
TOTAL GROUP A: (Items 1 — 9) $8,440,764.50 |$25,322,293.50 $163,050.20 | $489,150.60
Bidder's Price Bidder's Price:
$276,596.00 $829,788.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Vﬂa 2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
DATE: _ 1/15/2021 Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids Page 7 of 15
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

In Procurement»

2019 Award Winner

fi_

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids
BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021

BID NO: 2021-0179
DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance

Cummis Inc. dba Cummins Sales and Service MJ Mader Enterprises, Inc. dba Bio Dyne Chemical Co.
Columbus, OH El Paso, TX
Bidder 3 of 6 Bidder 4 of 6
GROUP B — TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC OILS, FLUIDS, AND GREASE
ESTIMATED | MANUFACTURER UNIT ANNUAL MANUFACTURER / UNIT ANNUAL
ITEM UNIT OF ANNUAL / 3-YR TOTAL 3-YR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL BRAND PRICE TOTAL
NO. MEASURE | QUANTITY BRAND (B) ©) (D) PRODUCT # B) ©) (D)
(A) PRODUCT #
1. Transynd Oil 55 gl 1,320 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Emgard 2805 $31.50 $41,580.00 | $124,740.00
) LV Mu::tl-l\llehlcle 55 o No Bid Transgard Syn MV
: ul 9 1,110 o bl No Bid No Bid No Bid LV ATF $10.25 $11,377.50 $34,132.50
Synthetic ATF
Multi-Vehicle Coastal MV
3. Synthetic 55 ¢l 1,430 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Synthetic Blend $10.75 $15,372.50 $46,117.50
Blend ATF ATF
Hydraulic Oil Citgo AW
4. Grade Bulk gl 12,050 |Valvoline VV0420| $5.89 $70,974.50 $212,923.50 90 7 $3.80 $45,790.00 $137,370.00
Hydraulic 46
ISO 46
Hydraulic Oil Ci
5. Grade 55 g| 220 Valvoline V044 | $435.25 | $95,755.00 $287,265.00 itgo AW $3.80 $836.00 $2,508.00
ISO 68 Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price: Hydraulic 68
$1,741.00 $5,223.00
Universal Tractor 110 . $435.25 $47,877.50 $143,632.50 Lubriguard Prem $6.50 $715.00 $2,145.00
6. . . 55 gl Valvoline VV040 .
Hydraulic Fluid ) ) Bidder's Price: Tractor Trans Fluid
Bidder's Price: $870.50
$1,741.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Vﬁa 2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
DATE: _ 1/15/2021 Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids Page 8 of 15




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids
BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021

Achievement of

In Procurement®

2019 Award Winner

BID NO: 2021-0179

DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance

Cummis Inc. dba Cummins Sales and Service

MJ Mader Enterprises, Inc. dba Bio Dyne Chemical Co.

Columbus, OH El Paso, TX
Bidder 3 of 6 Bidder 4 of 6
GROUP B — TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC OILS, FLUIDS, AND GREASE
ESTIMATED | MANUFACTURER UNIT ANNUAL MANUFACTURER / UNIT ANNUAL
ITEM UNIT OF ANNUAL / 3-YR TOTAL 3-YRTOTAL
DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL BRAND PRICE TOTAL
NO. MEASURE | QUANTITY BRAND (B) ) (D) PRODUCT # B) ©) (D)
(A) PRODUCT #
CITGO HYTHERM
7 OIL . Coastal Heat
- | 46 Heat Transfer | 229 330 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Transfer 46 $6.75 $2,227.50 $6,682.50
oil
8. | Heat Transfer Oil | 554l 110 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Coastal Heat $6.75 $742.50 $2,227.50
Transfer 46
9. | UCONSOOHeat } o 10,384 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid UCONS500 HTF | $4.90 | $50,881.60 | $152,644.80
Transfer Oil
CP Non-
Conductive . . . . Citgo Hydurance
10. Hydraulic Fluid 55gl 220 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AW CP Fluid $10.00 $2,200.00 $6,600.00
1ISO-100
Moly Extreme Lubriguard Prem
1. Pressure Lbs. 3,200 Valvoline 876338 | $1,639.00 || $5,244,800.00 | $15,734,400.00 Hi-Temp #2 with $2.60 $8,320.00 $24,960.00
NL Gl Grade -2 Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price: Moly
Based Grease $13,112.00 $39,336.00
TOTAL GROUP B: $5,459,407.00 | $16,378,221.00 $180,042.60 | $540,127.80
(ltems 1 - 11) e o
Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price:
$86,698.00 $260.094.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
v AaC I i
APPROVED BY: 2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
DATE: _ 1/15/2021 Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids Page 9 of 15




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids

BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021

Achievement of

In Procurements

2019 Award Winner -

ael.

BID NO: 2021-0179
DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance

Cummis Inc. dba Cummins Sales and Service
Columbus, OH

Bidder 3 of 6

MJ Mader Enterprises, Inc. dba Bio Dyne Chemical Co.
El Paso, TX

Bidder 4 of 6

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY
EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM
OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THESELECTED
OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT
SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND
CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF
EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR
TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM
OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within consecutive calendar days 7 1
Within hours or overnight after
. . 72 24
receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency
AMENDMENT ACKNOWLEDGED Yes Yes

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ©/AC
DATE: _ 1/15/2021

2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,

Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids

Page 10 of 15




Achievement of

CITY OF EL PASO

&
BID TABULATION FORM

‘)I!ll(-i‘lucuremenl J
2019 Award Winner

el

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids BID NO: 2021-0179
BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021 DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance
RJ Border International dba Border International Trucks Senergy Protroleum, LLC dba Senergy Petroleum
El Paso, TX Phoenix, AZ
Bidder 5 of 6 Bidder 6 of 6
GROUP A — ANTIFREEZE, MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS
ESTIMATED MANUFACTURER / UNIT ANNUAL MANUFACTURER UNIT ANNUAL
ITEM UNIT OF ANNUAL 3-YR TOTAL / 3-YR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION BRAND PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
NO. MEASURE | QUANTITY PRODUCT # B) ©) (D) BRAND (B) ©) (D)
(A) PRODUCT #
Premix 50/50 2,200 N/A Left Blank Left Blank P66 Shied $5.70 $12,540.00 | $37,620.00
1 Antifreeze Yellow 554l ’ Left Blank Coolant 50/50 ’ '
Premix 50/50
2. | Antifreeze Red/ | 554l 2,090 Left Blank $704.55 | $1,472,509.50 | $4,417,528.50 | ChevronDelo | g¢7.20 $15,048.00 | $45,144.00
Extended Life Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price: ELC 50/50
$26,772.90 $80,318.70
15w-40 CK-4 Diesel Maxx Pro LE
3. Conventional Bulk gl 15,000 Left Blank N/A Left Blank Left Blank 15W40 $6.64 $99,600.00 $298,800.00
Motor Oil
15w-40 Low Ash P66 El Mar L
4. | Natural Gas Motor | 55 gl 1,100 Left Blank N/A Left Blank Left Blank arLow | $7.60 $8,360.00 $25,080.00
oil Ash 15w40
SAE 5w-20
5. Conventional 55 gl 4,290 Left Blank N/A Left Blank Left Blank Maxx Pro 5w20 $5.20 $22,308.00 $66,924.00
Motor Oil
SAE 5w-30
6. Conventional 55 gl 3,660 Left Blank N/A Left Blank Left Blank Maxx Pro 5w30 $5.20 $19,032.00 $57,096.00
Motor Oil

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: V/VC 2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
DATE: _ 1/15/2021 Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids Page 11 of 15




Achievement of

Eéﬂ’ﬁﬁggm?
2019 Award Winner 15

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID NO: 2021-0179
DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids
BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021

RJ Border International dba Border International Trucks Senergy Protroleum, LLC dba Senergy Petroleum
El Paso, TX Phoenix, AZ
Bidder 5 of 6 Bidder 6 of 6
GROUP A — ANTIFREEZE, MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS
ESTIMATED| MANUFACTURER MANUFACTURER
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT OF ANNUAL / PUR":(I.:TE AT"g‘lTLLtL 3-YR TOTAL / Pl'g‘:(l.:TE Aer(;‘lTli\?_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. MEASURE | QUANTITY BRAND B) ©) (D) BRAND B) ©) (D)
(A) PRODUCT # PRODUCT #
7. SAE 30 Diesel . 55 gl 110 Left Blank N/A Left Blank Left Blank P66 T5X HD 30w $9.90 $1,089.00 $3,267.00
Supreme Plus Oil
g. | SAE S50 Synthetic | .. 110 | 5 GL Bucket Only | $2.833.58 | $311,693.80 | $935,081.40 P66 Triton $30.14 $3,315.40 $9,946.20
Gear / Trans Oil Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price: Transoil 50
$5,667.20 $17,001.60
SAE 80-140

9. . . 55 gl 1,226 Left Blank $2,179.50 | $2,672,067.00 | $8,016,201.00 Left Blank $24.43 $29,951.18 $89,853.54
Synthetic Gear Oil e L
$39.63 Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price:
$48,586.38 Per Gl $145,759.14

TOTAL GROUP A: (Items 1 - 9) $4,456,270.30 ||$13,368,810.90 $211,243.58 | $633,730.74
Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price:
$81,026.46 $243,029.38

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ©/AC

DATE: _ 1/15/2021

2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids

Page 12 of 15




Achievement of

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids
BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021

In Procurement»

2019 Award Winner

BID NO: 2021-0179
DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance

RJ Border International dba Border International Trucks Senergy Protroleum, LLC dba Senergy Petroleum
El Paso, TX Phoenix, AZ
Bidder 5 of 6 Bidder 6 of 6
GROUP B — TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC OILS, FLUIDS, AND GREASE
ESTIMATED| MANUFACTURER MANUFACTURER
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT OF ANNUAL / PUR":(I.:TE AT"g‘lTLLtL 3-YRTOTAL / Pl':;:(I.:TE AI_NONTLL?_L 3-YRTOTAL
NO. MEASURE | QUANTITY BRAND (B) (©) (D) BRAND (B) (©) (D)
(A) PRODUCT # PRODUCT #
1. Transynd Oil 55 gl 1,320 Left Blank $2,407.95 | $3,178,494.00 | $9,535,482.00 Left Blank $31.20 $41,184.00 $123,552.00
Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price:
$57,789.60 Per GL $173,368.80
LV Multi-Vehicle
2. Full 55 gl 1,110 Left Blank $1,332.07 | $1,478,597.70 | $4,435,793.10 Left Blank $10.05 $11,155.50 $33,466.50
Synthetic ATF Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price:
$26,884.20 Per GL $80,652.60
Multi-Vehicle
3. Synthetic 55 gl 1,430 Left Blank N/A Left Blank Left Blank Left Blank $8.80 $12,584.00 $37,752.00
Blend ATF
4. Hydraulic Oil Grade Bulk gl 12,050 55 gl $900.62 [$10,852,471.00 [|$32,557,413.00 Left Blank $5.20 $62,660.00 $187,980.00
ISO 46 Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price:
$197,379.00 Per GL $592,137.00
5. |Hydraulic Oil Grade] ., , 220 Left Blank $974.49 | $214,387.80 Left Blank Left Blank $5.87 $1,291.40 $3,874.20
ISO 68 Bidder's Price:
$3,898.40
6. | UniversalTractor | .5 110 Left Blank N/A Left Blank Left Blank Left Blank $6.64 $730.40 $2,191.20
Hydraulic Fluid

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ©/AC

DATE: _ 1/15/2021

2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids

Page 13 of 15




Achievement of

In Procurement®

2019 Award Winner

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids
BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021

BID NO: 2021-0179
DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance

RJ Border International dba Border International Trucks Senergy Protroleum, LLC dba Senergy Petroleum
El Paso, TX Phoenix, AZ
Bidder 5 of 6 Bidder 6 of 6
GROUP B — TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC OILS, FLUIDS, AND GREASE
ESTIMATED| MANUFACTURER MANUFACTURER
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT OF ANNUAL / PURr‘I"CTE ATr‘g‘lletL 3-YR TOTAL / PL:::éTE ATN(;\lTlfA,?_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. MEASURE | QUANTITY BRAND (B) (©) (D) BRAND (B) (©) (D)
(A) PRODUCT # PRODUCT #
CITGO HYTHERM
OIL
7 | 46 Heat Transfer | °°9 330 Left Blank N/A Left Blank Left Blank Left Blank $6.60 $2,178.00 $6,534.00
Oil
8. Heat Transfer Oil 55 gl 110 Left Blank N/A Left Blank Left Blank Left Blank $6.49 $713.90 $2,141.70
9. | UCONSOOHeat | o 10,384 Left Blank N/A Left Blank Left Blank Left Blank $5.04 | $52,335.36 | $157,006.08
Transfer Oil
CP Non-
Conductive
10. Hydraulic Fluid ISO 55 gl 220 Left Blank N/A Left Blank Left Blank Left Blank $7.89 $1,735.80 $5,207.40
100
Moly Extreme
1. Pressure Lbs 3,200 396 LB Drum $1,283.13 | $4,106,016.00 ($12,318,048.00 Left Blank $2.72 $8,704.00 $26,112.00
NL Gl Grade -2 ’ o ders Price:
Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price:
Based Grease $10,368.00 Per LB $31,104.00
TO'II'AL G:?Ol::’ B: $19,829,966.50 [[$58,846,736.10 $195,272.36 $585,817.08
( tems 1 - ) Bidder's Price: Bidder's Price:
$296,312.20 $877,262.40

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: / <C
DATE: _ 1/15/2021

2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids

Page 14 of 15




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

PROJECT NAME: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils & Fluids

BID OPENING DATE: January 6, 2021

‘Achievement of

In Procurement-

2019 Award Winner

BID NO: 2021-0179
DEPARTMENT: Streets & Maintenance

RJ Border International dba Border International Trucks
El Paso, TX

Bidder 5 of 6

Senergy Protroleum, LLC dba Senergy Petroleum
Phoenix, AZ

Bidder 6 of 6

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY
EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM
OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THESELECTED
OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT
SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND
CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR
DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO
EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF

EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR
TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM
OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

]

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within___ consecutive calendar days 40 Work in or LCCs 7
Within hours or overnight after
e T . 48 24
receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency
AMENDMENT ACKNOWLEDGED Yes Yes
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID. _
BIDS SOLICITED: 13 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 8 BIDS RECEIVED: 6 BIDS LOCAL: 3 NO BID: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: 4
DATE: _ 1/15/2021

2021-0179 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
Transmission and Hydraulic Oils Fluids

Page 15 of 15




SOLICITATION 2021-0178 BIDDERS LIST

MJ MADER ENTERPRISES, INC dba Southern Counties Lubricants Brewer Oil Company
Bio Dyne Chemical Company 1825 W. Collins, Ave. 1025 Wall St.
1315 W. Main Orange, CA 92863 El Paso, TX 79915

El Paso, TX 79902

C&R Distributing, LLC
8528 Alameda
El Paso, TX 79907

Five Star Fuel
9561 Rio Del Norte
El Paso, TX 79927

Texas Pride Fuels
93 FM 652
Orla, TX 79770

Honstein Oil and Distributing

4584 Ripley Dr.
El Paso, TX 79922

Gulf Oil

11432 Rudi Kuefner Dr.

El Paso, TX 79928

Senergy Petroleum

11535 Cedar Oak Dr.

El Paso, TX 79935

Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc.
2600 N. Central Expy
Richardson, TX 75080

Master Oil Company
9681 Joe Rodriguez
El Paso, TX 79927

Golden West Oil Co.
3010 Aniol St.
San Antonio, TX 78219
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