CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

AGENDA DATE: February 7, 2023

PUBLIC HEARING DATE: NA

CONTACT PERSON(S) NAME AND PHONE NUMBER:
Roberto Tinajero, Interim Director, International Bridges, 915-212-7509
K. Nicole Cote, Managing Director, Purchasing and Strategic Sourcing, (915) 212-
1092

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All

STRATEGIC GOAL: No. 1 - Cultivate an Environment Conducive to Strong, Sustainable Economic
Development.

SUBGOAL.: No. 1.5 - Stimulate economic growth through transit and bridges integration.

SUBJECT:

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2023-0134 Janitorial Services - International Bridges to
Ace Government Services, LLC, for an initial term of three (3) years for an initial estimated amount of $604,422.00.
The award also includes a two (2) year option for an estimated amount of $402,948.00. The total amount of the
contract is, including the initial term plus the option for a total of five (5) years, for an estimated amount of
$1,007,370.00. This contract will provide janitorial services to the International Bridges Department.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
This contract will allow the International Bridges Department to provide Janitorial Services to City of El Paso
International Bridges.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on November 8, 2022 and November 15, 2022. The solicitation was posted on
City website on November 8, 2022. There were a total of twenty-one (21) viewers online; four (4) bids were
received; three (3) being local.

CONTRACT VARIANCE:

The difference based in comparison to the previous contract is as follows: An increase of $227,329.20 for the
initial term, which represents a 60.28% increase due to higher hourly rates and an increase in service hours
required.

PROTEST
No protest received for this requirement.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
NA

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Amount: $604,422.00

Funding Source: 564-3300-522060-64830

Account: Maintenance Services Contract - Janitorial

HAVE ALL AFFECTED DEPARTMENTS BEEN NOTIFIED? _X YES NO

2023-0134 Janitorial Services - International Bridges
Revised 2/23/2022-V2 — Previous Versions Obsolete



PRIMARY DEPARTMENT: International Bridges
SECONDARY DEPARTMENT: Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing

*kkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkk R EQ U I R E D A U T H o R I ZATI O N********************

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Roberto Tinajero, Interim Director, International Bridges

2023-0134 Janitorial Services - International Bridges
Revised 2/23/2022-V2 — Previous Versions Obsolete



COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(Best Value)

********************************************POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW*********************************************

Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of February 7, 2023.

STRATEGIC GOAL NO. 1: Cultivate an Environment Conducive to Strong, Sustainable Economic
Development.

The linkage to Strategic Plan is subsection 1.5 — Stimulate economic growth through transit and bridges
integration.

Award Summary:

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2023-0134 Janitorial Services - International Bridges to
Ace Government Services, LLC, for an initial term of three (3) years for an initial estimated amount of $604,422.00.
The award also includes a two (2) year option for an estimated amount of $402,948.00. The total amount of the
contract is, including the initial term plus the option for a total of five (5) years, for an estimated amount of
$1,007,370.00. This contract will provide janitorial services to the International Bridges Department.

Contract Variance:

The difference based in comparison to the previous contract is as follows: An increase of $227,329.20 for the
initial term, which represents a 60.28% increase due to higher hourly rates and an increase in service hours
required.

Department: International Bridges

Award to: Ace Government Services, LLC
El Paso, TX

ltem(s): All

Initial Term: 3 Years

Option to Extend: 2 Years

Annual Estimated Award: $201,474.00

Initial Term Estimated Award: $604,422.00

Option Term Estimated Award: $402,948.00

Total Estimated Award: $1,007,370.00

Account No.: 564-3300-522060-64830

Funding Source Maintenance Services Contract - Janitorial

District(s): All

This is a Best Value, service contract.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing and the International Bridges Departments recommend award as indicated
to Ace Government Services, LLC, the highest ranked bidder based on evaluation factors established for this
procurement. In accordance with this award, the City Manager or designee is authorized to exercise future options
if needed.

********************************************ADDITIONAL INFO BELOW************************************************

DATE: 1/31/2023



Committee Scoresheet

CITY OF EL PASO BV SCORESHEET

PROJECT: Solicitation 2023-0134 Janitorial Services - International Bridges

Ace Government Services,

DSC Solutions LLC

Evaluation of Submittal

LLC GFE Buckingham LLC PJS of El Paso INC
EIP ™ Leola, PA El Paso, TX El Paso, TX
MAX POINTS aso,
Factor A - Offeror’s Fee Proposal 24.62 30.00 21.06 18.91
30
Proposed Cost $ 604,422.00 495,936.00 706,398.84 786,879.00

Factor B - Experience - Comparable Contracts 30 19.00 17.33 0.00 0.00

Factor C - References 30 20.00 20.00 0.00 0.00

Factor D — Employee Medical Benefit and Incentives 10 10.00 2.00 2.00 2.00
TOTAL SCORE 100 73.62 69.33 23.06 20.91

1 2 3 4

Effective 4/10/2020 Version 1 Previous Versions Obsolete



Project Name: Janitorial Services
Bid Opening Date: December 14, 2022

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

=

2022
Award
Winner

{8

Solicitation #: 2023-0134
Department: international Bridges

ACE Government Services, LLC DSC Solutions, LLC. GFE Buckingham, LLC Professional Janitorial Service of El Paso, Inc.
ElPaso, TX Leola, PA ElPaso, TX El Paso, TX
Bidder 1 of 4 Bidder 2 of 4 Bidder 3 of 4 Bidder 4 of 4
Monthly Estimated Estimated 3- Monthly Estimated Estimated 3- Monthly Estimated Estimated 3- Monthly Estimated Estimated 3-
ITEM Unit of Am:l;r:]trPer T:e‘:lmr:::::‘s Amount Annual Total Year Total Am:t;r:frPer T:et:m‘::;'s Amount Annual Total Year Total Am:l:’r:]trPer T:e‘:l'x;l::‘s Amount Annual Total Year Total Am:t;r::rPer T:::m‘:::‘s Amount Annual Total Year Total
No. DESCRIPTION Measure (C=AxB) (D=Cx12) (E=Dx3) (C=AxB) (D=Cx12) (E=Dx3) (C=AxB) (D=Cx12) (E=Dx3) (C=AxB) (D=Cx12) (E=Dx3)
(A) (B) (c) (D) (E) (A) (B) (c) (D) (E) (A) (B) (c) (D) (E) (A) (B) (c) (D) (E)
1 Paso Del Norte International Bridges Hourly $ 19.50 304 $ 592800 $ 71,136.00 $ 213,408.00 | $ 16.00 304 $ 486400 $ 58368.00 | $ 175104.00| $ 22.79 304 $ 692816 % 83,137.92|$ 24941376| $ 23.20 304 $ 705280 (% 84,633.60 | $ 253,900.80
2 Stanton Interantional Bridges Hourly $ 19.50 313 $ 610350 $ 73,242.00| $ 219,726.00 | $ 16.00 313 $ 5008.00|$ 60,09.00|$ 180,288.00| $ 22.79 313 $ 713327 |$ 8559924 $ 256,797.72| § 30.15 313 $ 9436.95|$ 113,24340 ($ 339,730.20
3 Zaragoza International Bridges Hourly $ 19.50 244 $ 475800 % 57,096.00| $ 171,288.00 | $ 16.00 244 $ 390400 | $ 46,848.00|$ 140,544.00| § 22.79 244 $ 5560.76 | $ 66,729.12 |$ 200,187.36 | § 22.00 244 $ 5368.00|$ 64,416.00$ 193,248.00
TOTAL
$ 201,474.00| $ 604,422.00 $ 165312.00( $ 495,936.00 $ 235466.28| $ 706,398.84 $ 262,293.00( $ 786,879.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual of
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE
AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE
ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE
AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE
SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT
SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND
CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY
EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF
EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO
THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
CONTRACT.
] ] O ]
AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED: YES YES YES YES
'EDS SOLICITED: 373 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 195 BIDS RECEIVED: 4 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 3 NO BID:
|NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual ion of

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 12/21/2022.

2023-0134 JANITORIAL SERVICES - INTERNATIONAL BRIDGES
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2023-0134 Janitorial Services - International Bridges

Bidders List
Participant Name Response Status
Colliers (New Mexico Real Estate Advisors Inc)
Construction Reporter Viewed

Crataegus, LLC. dba Jani-King of El Paso

Frank's Supply Company, Inc

NAPA Auto Parts

SMI Facility Services (Supreme Maintenance, Inc.)
Yearout Energy Services Company LLC

American Facility Services, Inc.

Sanil Electric Co., Ltd.

Momar Inc

Zep Sales and Service (Acuity Specialty Products, Inc)
Xcessories Squared Development & Mfg., Inc.

Dan Williams Company

Travis Association for the Blind - Austin, TX
www.jhdavidson.com

Busch Systems International Inc.

Classic Same Day Blinds

Bell's Security Sales Inc

The Kovacs Group (John Kovacs and Associates)
The Playwell Group, Inc.

State Industrial Products

GLOBEX-BURSA INTERNATIONAL TRADE (KEMAL ADLIG)
Mohawk Carpet Distribution, Inc.

Bright Growing Landscape and Maintenance (Guma Services, LLC)
Giant Electrical Services

watson extermination services inc. dba: watson pest management (watson pest management)
Complete Supply

Elite Line Services Inc

Harrison Bros. Inc. (harrison)

Homeland Industrial Supply (Homeland Industrial Supply Inc)
Snap-on Industrial, a Division of IDSC Holdings LLC
McKenzie Development LLC

Swarco Industries LLC

ADB Safegate Americas

Kimball Midwest (Midwest Motor Supply Co. Inc.)
Brown Mowing Service & Tree Trimming Inc,

Florence Filter Corporation

All Wire And Cable (Relies Group)

Generation H Cleaning Services LLC

All-Tech Associates

Goetting Construction Co.

Hi-Line Electric Co. Inc (Hi-Line, Inc)

Joe Fly Co Inc (JF Filtration, Inc)

KNS LLC

Liquid Environmental Solutions of Georgia, LLC
OVOL USA (Western BRW-Bosworth)

Pannell Industries Inc

piper weatherford

Summit Electric Supply

Sid Tools Inc. dba MSC Industrial Supply

SHOOP & SONS

DLP Services LLC (De La Paz Cleaning and Rental Services LLC)
Beacon Roofing Supply

Hercules Industries

RelaDyne

Dent Enterprises LLC

GARD Specialists

Denver Magnetic, Inc

PJS of El Paso, Inc. Submitted
GFE Buckingham LLC Submitted
Ace Government Services LLC Submitted
Bob's Pest Control, LLC No Bid
WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS (TE EL PASO,LLC) No Bid

2Casa Foster care (2 Casa Foster Care LLC.)

300 EXTERMINATOR TERMITE AND PEST CONTROL, LLC
3DS ELECTRICAL CONTRACOR LLC

AAA General Contractors, LLC

abood wheels

Access Communications Group, LLC

Aim Remodeling and Construction (MST Consulting)
Allied Paving

Alpha Line Detailing LLC

Alpha Paving (Alpha Asphalt and Parking Lot Contractors LLC)
Americhoice Construction LLC

APCO Building Specialties, Inc

Apex Pest Control (Lionel Clark dba Apex Pest Control)
APFELBAUM INDUSTRIAL, INC.

Aquatic Adventures LLC

Arrow Construction (CIM Ventures)

ARSPEC (Armendariz)

ASC General Contractors

ATS Inc (Advanced Transportation Services Inc)

Aztec Contractors Inc

Aztec Contractors, Inc.

BAKER GLASS COMPANY, INC

Baron Chemical Janitorial and Cleaning Supplies
Batteriesplusbulbs442 (Gorman Batteries LLC)

BE! GRAPHICS

BELLA IRRIGATION, LLC

Bella Luna Engineering and Building Maintenance Unsubmitted
Bio Dyne Chemical Co. (MJ Mader Enterprises Inc.)
Blue Sky Supplies, LLC

Border Tire

borderland services inc

Brady Industries (Brady Industries of Texas LLC)
Branavi Clean Solutions

bright bolt ent inc

C &L Janitorial Services

C.L. North Company (Keltic Inc)

Cardina Consulting LLC

City
Albuquerque
Albuquerque
Albuquerque
Albuquerque
Albuquerque
Albuquerque
albuquerque
ALPHARETTA
Ansan
Atlanta
Atlanta
Auburn
Austin
Austin
Austin
Barrie
Bedford
BLOOMFIELD
Boerne
Boerne
Boston
BURSA
Calhoun
Canutillo
Canutillo
Canutillo
Carrollton
Carrollton
Chapel Hill, NC
Chester Heights
Chicago
Clint
Columbia
Columbus
Columbus
Commerce
Compton
Coral Springs
Crowley
Dallas
Dallas
Dallas
Dallas
Dallas
Dallas
Dallas
Dallas
Dallas
Dallas
Davidson
Decatur

Del Rio Blvd
Denver
Denver

Des Plaines
DeSoto
Eagle River
Eastlake

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

EL PASO

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

el paso

El Paso

El Paso

el paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

EL PASO

El Paso

El Paso

EL PASO

El Paso

El Paso

EL PASO

El Paso

EL PASO

El Paso

El Paso

EL PASO

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

el paso

El Paso

El Paso

el paso

El paso

El Paso

EL PASO

State
NM
NM
NM
NM
NM
NM
NM
GA
Gyeonggi-do Korea, Republic of
GA
GA
L
X
X
X
ON Canada
X
NJ
X
X
MA
Bursa Turkey
GA
X
X
X
X
X
NC
PA
L
X
™
OH
OH
X
CA
FL
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
NC
L
X
co
co
L
X
Wi
co
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
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2023-0134 Janitorial Services - International Bridges

Bidders List
Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc.
CED El Paso Viewed
Chato's Quarter Horses & Alfalfa Hay Sales
City Fence and Pipe Co.
City of El Paso Strategic Partners
Clean Sweep Janitorial Services
CodeLumen
continental battery company
Continental Termite & Pest Control, Inc.
Coretech
D&H United Fueling Solutions
D.AAB.LLC
dale borens service supply
DAVID'S PENNANTS, BANNERS
Dedicated Logistics Group LLC
Delgado’s Repair and Maintenance
Delta Pest Control & Lawn Service (Delta Unlimited LLc)
DESERT ELECTRICAL SUPPLY, INC.
Desert Paint Store
Desert Painting LLC
DH Pace El Paso (DH Pace Company Inc)
DIVISION 7 LLC
Dual Temp Refrigeration. (A.B.R. HVAC & MAINTENANCE SERVICES LLC.)
DYER CYCLE
eagle janitorial services
Efficio Construction Services LLC
El Paso & Juarez Paint Inc. Viewed
EL PASO CASTERS & MATERIAL HANDLING (CASTERS UNLIMITED)
El Paso CWI & NDE Inspection Services, LLC
El Paso Handyman LLC
EL PASO JAG INC.
EL PASO METALS & SUPPLY,INC
El Paso Pipe & Pump Supply
el paso trench safety inc
EL PASO-PHOENIX PUMPS INC
El Valle Pest Control LLC
EPTEX Coatings
Ewing Irrigation
Facility solutions group
Freedom environmental group
Fulcrum Contracting Group LLC
Fulcrum Pest Control
Full Turn Interior Solutions, LLC
Global Containers & Custom Packaging Inc.
GLOBAL SALES AND SERVICE
GLOBAL SUPPLY & SERVICE INC.
Goliath Security Services LLC
Goodwill Services Inc.
Gracen Engineering & Construction, Inc.
Graybar electric
Hawk Construction
HCV ENTERPRISES, LLC
Hi-tech Home Services (Tech Roofing Inc)
Holiday Inn Express & Suites- Sunland Park Area
Howdy Resources (CNH Construction LLC)
HZ Construction
Innovative Ink Signs & Printing (Innovative Ink EP, LP)
Integrated Technologies and Design (Electripro Inc)
Integrity Pest and Termite (Sun City Critter Control Corp LLC)
Internal Audit Office
J Carrizal General Constructio
Jace Contracting Services, Inc.

JDA Property Solutions LLC Unsubmitted

Jobe Materials

JR Compass LLC Viewed
Jurado Construction lic

King Arthur's

Klean-it Janitorial Services

KS Construction LLC Viewed
Lara Construction

LB & SONS (LB Landscaping Inc)

LD Supply Company, Inc.

Life Landscaping

Lim Service Industries Inc. Unsubmitted

Li-Neon Media Group

Lobo Distribution LLC

LUX lllumination LLC

MACNEILL AND SONS GENERAL CONTRACTORS
MAID IN BLISS,LLC

Maintenance Unlimited, Inc.

Mayer's Glass & Construction

Mayfield Pool Supply, LP

Mean Clean LLC

Medlock Commercial Contractors, LLC.

MG Evergreen LLC

Midwest Restoration Group LLC

MIJARES-MORA ARCHITECTS INC

Mirador Enterprises, Inc. (Mirador Enterprises)
Mission Linen Supply

Mosquito Squad of El Paso/Las Cruces (G&T Southwest LLC)
MTI Ready Mix (MULLEN/TELLES INCORPORATED)
New Generation Construction Crew

P&V Distributing

P&Y Pump Service (P&Y Mobile Wash Inc)

PC Automated Controls, Inc

PERIKIN Enterprises LLC

Precision MPI (MPI Machinery and Design LLC)
Prestige Construction Group

Prime Irrigation & Landscape, Inc

Pulse Electric, Inc.

RAD Painting (Ricardo DeLucio)

RBM Engineering, Inc.

El Paso
El Paso
EL Paso
El Paso
El Paso
El Paso
El Paso
El Paso
el paso
El Paso
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el paso
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Red Feather Affordable Landscaping Inc (Robert Girardot)
Refrigeration Express (AS General Contractors LLC)
Reliable Plumbing (RP of EPT Inc)

RENT A TRAILER LLC (Carlos Fraire)

Rick Rodriguez Construction

Ricks Paving & Sealing Inc.

Rio Grande Lighting

Robles1 Demolition

Rocky Mountain Distribution LLC

Roger Brown Co. LLC

Rolo Fix It

Roof Toppers of El Paso Inc.

S&T Refrigeration

Safe Space Cleaning Services

Safety-Kleen

Selati Investments

Sefior Clean (Edith Castarion)

Servin, LLC

Servpro of West El Paso (BLMR Disaster Recovery LLC)
Sherwin Williams Company

Sierra Machinery, Inc.

SJl and Associates LLC

Socorro ISD

Southwest Premier Services, LLC

Southwestern Mill Distributors

Spartan Construction of TX, Inc.

Spectrum Paper

STANLEY STEEMER (Manitou Makwa LLC)

Stiles General Contractors LLC

Sun Carpets, LLC

SWIFCO (SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS)
Synergy Temperature Control LLC

SYOXSA, Inc.

The Cable Source (The Cable Source Ltd. Co.)
The Planlt Room

Trad Xpertz LLC

Tristar Aeronautical inc

UniFirst (UniFirst Corporation)

UNIK-TECH LLC

VJ Capital Properties, Ltd.

WESTERN JANITORIAL SERVICE INC

WinSupply of El Paso (WinSupply of El Paso TX Co)
WOODBRID, LLC

WW Grainger

Wyler Industrial Works, Inc.

Ysleta ISD

Yucca Contracting (Israel Vaquera)

Octavios Custom Draperies

Technical Building Services (JiVG Enterprises LLC)
TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.

Morrow Industrial Repair Service, LLC

2023-0134 Janitorial Services - International Bridges
Bidders List

Viewed

DIGI Security Systems and Alpha Lock (DIGI Security Systems LLC and Alpha Lock)
Superior Elevator Inspections & Consulting (Superior Elevator Inspections, LLC)

Ironcompany.com, LLC

GBSON & GBSON LLC

MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS
Mid-Continental Restoration Co Inc
KreativDesk (Tometys Inc)

LineQuest LLC.

Sunbelt Rentals, Inc

Quality MRO (Price Global Logistics LLC)
Sanus Solutions LLC

Allstates Coatings Company (LBS Enterprises, LLC)
Plumbmaster, Inc

FCI Constructors, Inc.

Urban Restoration Group U.S. Inc.
Simpson Norton Corporation

American Sealants, Inc. (ASI)

North America Procurement Council Inc., PBC
ERMC Aviation Services

Pollock Investments Inc (Pollock Orora)
NorrisLeal, LLC

FNJ Enterprises LLC

West Texas Chiller Solutions

Amtek USA, Austin

Epoxy Design Systems, Inc.

Heat and Power Boiler Services, Inc.
Liberty Office Products

Possible Missions, Inc.

Pritchard Industries

Sunset Survival & First Aid Inc

Texas Correctional Industries (Texas Department of Criminal Justice)

Tough Shirts

ARCHIVE SUPPLIES INC

justin seed

Indoff, Inc (Indoff, Incorporated)
Safety Counts Inc.
TLBSCORPORATION

Discount Banners and Signs Inc
Tower Performance LLC

ABBA CONSTRUCTION, LLC
Burke Insurance Group (Risk Strategies Company)
PROCON JCB

METRO WIRE AND CABLE
DSC Solutions LLC

MALLORY SAFETY & SUPPLY

Unsubmitted

Submitted

Rain for Rent (Western Qilfields Supply Company dba Rain for Rent)

VersaTables

Facility Gateway Corporation

Reflective Apparel

Property Registration Champions, LLC dba PROCHAMPS

DITCH WITCH SOUTHWEST (WEST-TEX MARKETING, LTD.)

El Paso

El Paso

EL Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

el paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

EL PASO

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

EL PASO

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

EL PASO

El Paso

EL PASO

El Paso

EL PASO

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX
ELIZABETH
Elkton
Farmers Branch
FENTON
Flower Mound
Fort Worth
FORT WORTH
Fort Worth
Frisco

Frisco

Ft Mill
Garland
Garland
Gladewater
GLEN MILLS
Glendale
Glendale
Goodyear
Grand Junction
Grand Junction
GRAND PRAIRIE
Grand Prairie
Harlingen
Horizon City
Horizon City
Houston
Houston
Houston
Houston
Houston
Houston
Huntington Beach
Huntsville
Huntsville
IRVING
Justin
Kansas City
Katy

katy

Keller

Krotz Springs
LAREDO

Las Cruces
Las Cruces
Lawrenceville
Leacock-Leola-Bareville
LONGVIEW
Los Angeles
Los Angeles
Madison
Marietta
Melbourne
Midland

X
X
X
X
T
X
X
T
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
T
X
X
T
X
X
T
X
X
T
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
NJ
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X
MO
X
X

X
X
X
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X
X
X
PA
AZ
CA
AZ
Cco
Cco
X
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X
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X
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X
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X
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X
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PA
WA
CA
CA
Wi
GA
FL
X



2023-0134 Janitorial Services - International Bridges

Bidders List

305 Goformore LLC Milpitas CA
306 Harcourt Outlines, Inc. (Harcourt Industries, Inc.) Milroy IN
307 INTERBORO PACKAGING CORPORATION MONTGOMERY NY
308  Muncie Transit Supply (Muncie Reclamation and Supply) Muncie IN
309 DAI Scientific Equipment Inc Mundelein IL
310 Best Plumbing Specialties Myersville MD
311 TECHLINE INC No Bid NEW BRAUNFELS X
312  Divine Power Group (Boddicker Ventures, LLC) New Braunfels X
313  ALL IN SAFETY CORP (All In Safety Corp) New Windsor NY
314  ADB Safegate Americas, LLC New York NY
315  Ferguson Enterprises Newport News VA
316  Norfolk Bearings & Supply Co., Inc. Norfolk VA
317 LABSOURCE INC NORTHLAKE L
318  ADVANCED FILTRATION CONCEPTS Norwalk CA
319  Myers Power Products Ontario CA
320 Owens Realty Services Orlando FL
321 Scotwood Industries, LLC Overland Park KS
322  SOLUTIONS PEST AND LAWN No Bid PASADENA X
323  School Specialty LLC Philadelphia PA
324  Copper State Bolt & Nut Phoenix AZ
325 CORE Construction Phoenix AZ
326 Medaserv (Strong Medical Partners LLC) Pineville NC
327 HITEQ COMPUTER SYSTEMS (PROLEAF CORPORATION) PLANO X
328 TELSUPPLIERS LLC PLANO X
329  Vector Controls Plano X
330 IWCS Scale LLC raymondville X
331  Rentokil North America, Inc. (Target Specialty Products) Reading PA
332 Best Wire &Cable LLC Richardson X
333  Longhorn Excavators, Inc. Richmond TX
334  GLK Turf Solutions LLC Royse City X
335  IML Security Supply (Intermountain Lock & Security Supply) No Bid Salt Lake City uT
336  3rd Generation Services, LLC San Antonio TX
337  Amstar Inc. General Contractor San Antonio T
338 H.A. Gray & Associates, Inc. San Antonio X
339  Pan-American Filtration (MB Dustless Air Filter Company, LLC) San Antonio X
340  Sunset Brokers LLC San Antonio X
341  Virtual Builders Exchange San Antonio X
342  Woodeez Stone & Laser Imaging (Woodeez Woodcrafts, LLC) San Antonio X
343  SitSpots (JB Distributors, Inc.) San Clemente CA
344 NEBULA ADVISERS LLC Santa Fe NM
345  High Intensity Electrical Contractors LLC (High Intensity Electrical Contractors LLC.) Santa Teresa NM
346  Continental Flooring Company Scottsdale AZ
347 WCD Enterprises, LLC (Dryden) Scottsdale AZ
348  Aerosimple LLC Sheridan wy
349 AR.E. Landscape Management Socorro X
350  Automatic Trap Company Sonoma CA
351  Jamieson Facility Services Splendora X
352  United Laboratories, Inc St. Charles IL
353  Indepth Utility Solutions LLC Stafford X
354 RANCO Response LLC StatesBoro GA
355  Stertil-Koni USA, Inc. Stevensville MD
356  Matco Tools (Matco Tools Corporation) Stow OH
357  Construction Journal Stuart FL
358  Dynamic Contracts Consultants LLC Sugarland X
359  G.A. Braun, Inc. SYRACUSE NY
360  Filterbuy Incorporated No Bid Talladega AL
361 ALPHAPROMED,LLC tampa FL
362 BAY PROMO LLC (baypromo.net) Tampa FL
363 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) TAMPA FL
364 NASG Holdings Trumbauersville PA
365  Mister Car Wash Tucson AZ
366 Wassco Corporation Tulsa OK
367 Dunn-Edwards Corportation Vernon CA
368  Winsupply W El Paso VINTON X
369 One Stop Janitorial Services LLC Weslaco X
370  Unipak Corp. West Long Branch NJ
371 Champion Wire & Cable No Bid Westbury NY
372  ADA Solutions, a Division of SureWerx USA Inc. (SureWerx USA, Inc.) Wilmington MA
373  Royal Imaging Solutions (Royal Media Network, Inc.) Windsor Mill MD
374  ACP Facility Services, Inc. Woburn MA

375  Turf Care of Texas Wylie X





