
2022-0656 Laboratory Services for MSW Facilities (Re-Bid) 

Revised 2/23/2022-V2 – Previous Versions Obsolete 

CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS 
AGENDA ITEM  

DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM 

AGENDA DATE: November 8, 2022 
PUBLIC HEARING DATE: Not Applicable  

CONTACT PERSON(S) NAME AND PHONE NUMBER: 
Terry K. Kebschull, Animal Services Director, (915) 212-8742 
Claudia A. Garcia, Interim Director of Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing, (915) 212-1218 

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED:  All 

STRATEGIC GOAL: No. 8 – Nurture and Promote a Healthy, Sustainable Community 

SUBGOAL: 8.3 – Enhance animal services to ensure El Paso’s pets are provided a safe and 
healthy environment.  

SUBJECT: 
Discussion and action of the award of Solicitation No. 2022-0850 Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) to Manuel 
Talamantes, III dba El Paso Veterinary Supply and Steris Corporation dba Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC., for an initial term of 
three (3) years for an estimated amount of $1,153,238.58.  

Group I (Items 1-4, 7, 9-58, 61-81 and 83) 
Group II (Items 1-9, 12-31, 34-62, 64-73 and 75-96) to be awarded to Manuel Talamantes, III dba El Paso Veterinary 
Supply for an initial three (3) year term for an estimated amount of $1,149,258.54. 

Group II (Items 10, 11 and 32) to be awarded to Steris Corporation dba Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC., for an initial three (3) 
year term for an estimated amount of $3,980.04. 

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION: 
This contract will allow Animal Services to procure surgical, medications, antibiotics, test kits and other medical supplies 
needed for animals in their care. 

SELECTION SUMMARY: 
Solicitation was advertised on July 26, 2022 and August 8, 2022. The solicitation was posted on City website on July 26, 
2022. There was a total of one hundred thirty-one (131) viewers online; two (2) bids were received; one (1) from a local 
vendor. An inadequate competition survey was conducted. 

CONTRACT VARIANCE:  
The difference in price, based on comparison to the previous contract is as follows: An increase of $379,571.64 for the initial 
term, which represents a 49.06% increase due to prices increased as well as the quantities for the requested items increased. 

PROTEST 
No protest received for this requirement. 

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION: 
NA 

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING: 
Amount: $1,153,238.58 
Funding Source: Non-Federal Funds 
Account: 225-2580-25120-531120 



2022-0656 Laboratory Services for MSW Facilities (Re-Bid) 

Revised 2/23/2022-V2 – Previous Versions Obsolete 

HAVE ALL AFFECTED DEPARTMENTS BEEN NOTIFIED?  _X__ YES ___NO 

PRIMARY DEPARTMENT: Environmental Services 
SECONDARY DEPARTMENT: Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing 

_______________________________________________________________________________ 

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION******************** 

DEPARTMENT HEAD: 

________________________________________________________________________ 
Terry K. Kebschull, Animal Services Director 



COUNCIL PROJECT FORM 
(Low Bid) 

 
*****************************************POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW*************************************** 
 
Please place the following item on the REGULAR AGENDA for the Council Meeting of November 8, 2022. 
 
STRATEGIC GOAL NO. 8: Nurture and Promote a Healthy, Sustainable Community 
 
The linkage to the Strategic Plan is subsection 8.3: Enhance animal services to ensure El Paso's pets are 
provided a safe and healthy environment.  
 
Award Summary: 
Discussion and action of the award of Solicitation No. 2022-0850 Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) to 
Manuel Talamantes, III dba El Paso Veterinary Supply and Steris Corporation dba Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC, 
for an initial term of three (3) years for an estimated amount of $1,153,238.58. This contract will allow Animal 
Services to procure surgical, medications, antibiotics, test kits and other medical supplies needed for animals 
in their care. 
 
Contract Variance: 
The difference in price based on comparison to the previous contract is as follows: An increase of 
$379,571.61 for the initial term, which represents a 49.06% increase due to quantity and price increases. 
 
Department:  Animal Services  
Vendor # 1: Manuel Talamantes, III dba El Paso Veterinary Supply 

 El Paso, TX  
Item(s): Group I (Items 1-4, 7, 9-58, 61-81 and 83)  

 Group II (Items 1-9, 12-31, 34-62, 64-73 and 75-96) 
Initial Term: 3 years 
Annual Estimated Award: $383,086.18  
Total Estimated Award: $1,149,258.54 (3 years) 
  
  
Vendor # 2: Steris Corporation dba Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC 

 Chicago, IL  
Item(s): Group II (Items 10, 11 and 32) 
Initial Term: 3 years 
Annual Estimated Award: $1,326.68  
Total Estimated Award: $3,980.04 (3 years) 

  
  

Total Annual Amount: $384,412.86 (2 Vendors) 
Total Estimated Award: $1,153,238.58 (3 years) (2 Vendors) 
Account No.: Non-Federal Funds 
Funding Source: 225-2580-25120-531120 
District(s): All 

 
This is a low bid, unit price contract. 
 
The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing and Animal Services Departments recommend award as indicated 
to Manuel Talamantes, III dba El Paso Veterinary Supply and Steris Corporation dba Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. 
LLC, the lowest, responsive and responsible bidders.  
 
 



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

7

3

4

5

6

9

 $  174.95 

 $  6,200.00 

 $  - 

 $  - 

 $  12,750.00 

 $  - 

 $  659.00 

524.85$   

18,600.00$   

-$   

-$   

38,250.00$   

 No Bid  $  - -$   

5 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

1000 Bottles No Bid  No Bid 

1

2

ITEM 

No.

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNTDESCRIPTION

 $  130.59 

 $  5.99 

 $  34.99 

 $  6.20 

 $  - 

 $  - 

Bottles No Bid

Bidder's 

Brand

Virbac

Generic

Generic

Zoetis

No Bid

No Bid

 $  1,305.90 

 $  59.90 

3,917.70$   

179.70$   

Amoxicillin/clavulinic ac. Susp. 400/57 5 

ml/bottle

Anamax ointment 240 ml/bottle

Arithromycin 40 mg/ml bottles

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

Amoxicillin/clavulinic ac. 200/28.5 tabs 20 

tabs/bottle

Amoxicillin 500 mb/caps 500 cap/ bottle

Amoxicillin drops 15 ml/bottles

Amoxicillin/clavulinic ac. 400/57 tabs 20 

tabs/bottle

Amoxicillin 100 mg/tabs 500 tab / bottle

Amoxicillin 250 mg/tabs 100 cap/ bottle

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2

GROUP I: Antibotics and Miscellaneous Medication

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

10 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

10

 $  - -$   

3000 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

3000 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

3000 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$    $  4.25 Generic

3 Bottles -$   No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

100 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

1,977.00$   

 $  - 

 $  6.59 

No Bid

Generic

8

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 1



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850
Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

Zoetis

Zoetis

Zoetis

Generic

Generic

Generic

Generic

 $  331.00 

 $  1,335.80 

 $  119.90 

 $  246.00 

 $  6.62 

 $  66.79 

 $  462.80 

 $  9,589.50 

 $  48.09 

 $  147.00 

 $  203.63 

 $  735.00 

993.00$   

4,007.40$   

359.70$   

738.00$   

1,388.40$   

28,768.50$   

144.27$   

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Generic

Vedco

Zoetis

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

441.00$   

610.89$   

2,205.00$   

11

10

Cerenia (Maripotant) Tablets 16 mg

Cerenia (Maripotant) Tablets 24 mg

Cerenia (Maripotant) Tablets 60 mg

Carprofen (Rymadil) injectiiin-50 MG/ML-20 

ml/bottle

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Bottles (50 

tablets)

18 Cephalexin 500 mg/tab 500 tab/bottle

19 Cephalexin Susp. 250 mg/5ml 100 ml/bottle

 $  11.99 

 $  12.30 

 $  23.14 

 $  191.79 

 $  48.09 

 $  14.70 

Cerenia (Maripotant) Injectable 10 mg/ml

Cephalexin 250 mg/tabs 50 tab/bottle

1 Box (25 

bottles/box

)

13

14

15

16

17

12

Cefazolin injectable bottle

Arithromycin 250 mg tablets

 $  29.09 

 $  14.70 

Bidder's 

Brand
ITEM 

No.

50 No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2
GROUP I: Antibotics and Miscellaneous Medication

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

UNIT PRICE

20
Injectable 

Bottles
No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

10 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

20 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

20 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

50 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

1 No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

10 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

7 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

50 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 2



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850
Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

20 Ciprofloxacin 250 mg

21 Ciprofloxacin 500 mg

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT PRICE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

30 Dermachlor scrub 2% Gallon

Bidder's 

Brand

22 Clavamox tablets 62.5 mg

24 Clavamox tablets 375 mg

25 Clavamox Drops 15 ml Zoetis

26 Convenia inj. 10 ml/bottle

27 Dexametasone 2 mg 100 ml/bottle

Bottles

Box (4 

tabs/cared; 

10 

cards/box)

Box (4 

tabs/cared; 

10 

cards/box

Zoetis

Zoetis

Zoetis

Zoetis

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

 $  50.16 

 $  215.71 

 $  19.37 

 $  376.38 

 $  7.09 

 $  40.05 

 $  32.82 

 $  30.33 

28 Doxycline 100 mg/tabs 500 tabs/bottle

Depomedrol injectable 40 mg/ml bottle29

3 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

3 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

20 No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

Generic

Generic

 $  12.00 

 $  14.29 

 $  36.00 

 $  42.87 

 $  1,003.20 

108.00$   

128.61$   

3,009.60$   

20 No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

200 No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

50 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

5 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   Vedco

 $  4,314.20 

 $  3,874.00 

 $  18,819.00 

 $  35.45 

12,942.60$   

11,622.00$   

56,457.00$   

106.35$   

 No Bid  $  - -$   

5 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

20 Gallons No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

Generic

Zoetis

Vedco

 $  801.00 

 $  164.10 

 $  606.60 

2,403.00$   

492.30$   

1,819.80$   

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2
GROUP I: Antibotics and Miscellaneous Medication

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

20 Bottles No Bid

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 3



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

15,502.20$   

7,110.00$   

8,338.50$   

10,488.00$   

18,975.00$   

4,930.20$   

4,146.00$   

Dechra

Vedco

Enrofloxicin (Baytril) Tablets 68 mg

Generic

Dechra

Dechra

Dechra

Bidder's 

Brand

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

UNIT OF 

MEASURE
UNIT PRICE

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

No Bid

 $  258.37 

 $  41.04 

35

33 Enrofloxicin (Baytril) 100 mg/ml injectable

34 Enrofloxicin (Baytril) Tablets 22.7 mg

No BidZoetis

 $  - -$   

20 Box of 5  No Bid  $  - -$   

3 Box of 20 369.36$    No Bid  $  - -$   

Generic

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

39 Erythromycin eye ointment tube

37 Epinephrine 1/1000 30 ml/bottle

36

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

31
Diroban Injection 25 mg/ml-5 vials/box-1 

ml/vial

32
Diphenhydramine HCL INJECTION, 50 

MG/ML-25 vials/box

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

 $  47.40 

 $  55.59 

 $  69.92 

 $  126.50 

 $  27.39 

 $  13.82 

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

 $  5,167.40 

 $  123.12 

 $  2,370.00 

 $  2,779.50 

 No Bid  $  - -$   

 No Bid  $  - -$   

 No Bid 

50 Bottles

50 Bottles

50 Bottles

50 Bottles

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

ITEM 

No.

Enrofloxicin (Baytril) Tablets 132 mg -$   

 $  3,496.00 

 $  6,325.00 

60 Bottles  No Bid  $  - -$   

100 Tubes  No Bid  $  - -$   

 $  1,643.40 

 $  1,382.00 

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2

GROUP I: Antibotics and Miscellaneous Medication

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

 No Bid  $  - 

38
ENTYCE (CAPROMORELIN) ORAL 

SOLUTION 10 ml/botlle
30 Bottles Elanco  $  27.99  $  839.70 2,519.10$   No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 4



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850
Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

No Bid

No BidGeneric  $  131.19  $  1,967.85 5,903.55$   

 $  50.69  $  253.45 760.35$   

Elanco  $  43.39  $  4,339.00 13,017.00$   

Dechra  $  158.49  $  792.45 2,377.35$   

 $  6.19  $  185.70 557.10$   

Generic  $  16.49  $  82.45 247.35$   

Generic

40 Famotadine 10 mg/ml Bottle

41

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

FLUCONAZOLE TABLETS, USP, 200 MG- 

100 tabs/bottle

42 Intrafungol 52 ml bottles

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

48
Meloxicam (Ostilox) injectable 5 mg/ml (20 

ml bottle)

 $  - -$   

 No Bid  $  - -$   

 No Bid  $  - -$   

Bags  No Bid  $  - -$   

Generic

Dechra

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

46 Lixotinic (1 gal. bottle)

43

 No Bid 

Lactated Ringers IV bags 1 liter 24/case

 $  130.70  $  392.10 1,176.30$   

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

5 Bottles

100 Bottles

5 Cases

3044
Lactated Ringers IV Sol. w/5% dextrose 

1000 ml/bag (12/case)

45 Lixotinic (1 gal. bottle)

40 Bottles  $  494.80 1,484.40$    No Bid  $  - -$   Generic  $  12.37 No Bid

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

5 Bottles  No Bid  $  - -$   

3 Gallons  No Bid  $  - -$   

60 Tubes  No Bid  $  - -$   

15 Bottles  No Bid  $  - -$   

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

47
Marquis (15% Ponazuril) Paste Syringe 4x 

127 mg
Boe/Ing  $  247.95  $  14,877.00 44,631.00$   

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2
GROUP I: Antibotics and Miscellaneous Medication

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 5



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

Generic

Generic

Generic

Boe/Ing

Generic

Generic

Vedco

 $  4.79 

 $  21.05 

 $  31.99 

 $  52.60 

 $  9.03 

 $  7.09 

 $  13.60 

 $  23.95 

 $  210.50 

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Boe/Ing  $  151.63  $  3,790.75 

631.50$   

479.85$   

3,945.00$   

2,709.00$   

7,657.20$   

408.00$   

11,372.25$   

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid51

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

 $  159.95 

 $  1,315.00 

 $  903.00 

 $  2,552.40 

 $  136.00 

71.85$   

50

52
NEXGARD CHEWABLES FOR DOGS, RED, 

EXTRA LARGE, 60.1-121 LB, 10 x 3 Dose

UNIT PRICE
ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Metronidazole 250 mg/tab 500 tab/bottle

Bidder's 

Brand

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Metoclopramide HCL Tablets, 5 mg, 100ct., 

Generic Reglan
49

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

Metronidazole 500 mg/tab 500 tab/bottle

53 Neo-Poly-Dex 3.5 mg

54 Neo-Poly-Dex 8oz./tube

55 Nitrofurazone ointment 1lb

56
ONSIOR (ROBENACOXIB) INJECTION 20 

MG/ML-20 ml/bottle

-$   

ITEM 

No.

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

-$   

360 Tubes  No Bid  $  - -$   

10 Jars  No Bid  $  - -$   

25
Bottles 

Injectable
 No Bid  $  - -$   

5 Bottles  No Bid  $  - -$   

10 Bottles  No Bid  $  - -$   

5 Bottles  No Bid  $  - -$   

25

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2

GROUP I: Antibotics and Miscellaneous Medication

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

100 Tubes  No Bid  $  - 

Box No Bid  No Bid  $  - 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 6



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

Purina

Vedco

 $  137.50 

 $  11.79 

 $  - 

 $  - 

 $  360.35 

 $  208.75 

 $  82.00 

 $  42.00 

 $  119.31 

 $  18.99 

 $  1,375.00 

 $  825.30 

630.00$   

3,579.30$   

569.70$   

 $  1,193.10 

 $  189.90 

4,125.00$   

2,475.90$   

-$   

-$   

10,810.50$   

3,131.25$   

1,230.00$   

 $  - 

 $  - 

 $  3,603.50 

 $  1,043.75 

 $  410.00 

 $  210.00 

No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

Generic

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

70 Bottles

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

59
Penject Procaine Penicillin G 300,000 

units/ml, 250 ml

57 Pancur Susp. 10%, 100 ml/bottle

58
Penject Procaine Penicillin G 300,000 

units/ml, 100 ml

60
Penject Procaine Penicillin G 300,000 

units/ml, 500 ml

61 Praziquantel tab. Canine 150 tab/bottle

62 Praziquantel tab. Feline 50 tab/bottle

Merk

Vedco

No Bid

No Bid

Bayer

Bayer

10 Bottles

63 Prednisone 20 mg/tab 1000 tabs/bottle

64 Prednisone 5 mg/tab 1000 tabs/bottle

65 Purina FortiFloria Feline

66 Rimadyl 25 mg/tab 60 tabs/bottle

150 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

50 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

10 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

5 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

5 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

5 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   Generic

10 Cases No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

10 Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2
GROUP I: Antibotics and Miscellaneous Medication

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 7



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

2,579.70$   

1,559.40$   

6,153.84$   

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

10

10

20

6

6

6

6

6

6

3

3

Bottles

 $  38.00 

 $  780.00 

 $  859.90 

 $  519.80 

 $  2,051.28 

 $  2,092.14 

 $  2,283.78 

 $  14.67 

 $  114.00 

7,143.48$   

44.01$   

342.00$   

No Bid

Package

2,340.00$   

 $  396.86 

 $  4.89 

 $  391.62 

Vedco

Vedco

Generic

Zoetis

 $  78.00 

 $  85.99 

 $  25.99 

 $  341.88 

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

71
Simparica Chewable 5.6-11.1 lbs (10 

pk/case)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

 $  2,107.86 

 $  2,349.72 

 $  2,381.16 

6,276.42$   

6,323.58$   

6,851.34$   

7,049.16$   

77
TRAZODONE HCL TABLETS, USP, 50 MG - 

500 tabs

75
Simparica Chewable 120 mg 88.1-132.0 lbs 

(10 pk/case)

76
TERBINAFINE HCL TABLETS, USP, 250 MG 

- 30/bottle

73
Simparica Chewable 40 mg 22.1-44.1 lbs 

(10 pk/case)

74
Simparica Chewable 80 mg 44.1-88.1 lbs 

(10 pk/case)

Zoetis

Zoetis

Zoetis

Zoetis

Zoetis

Generic

Generic

Cases

69

 $  348.69 

 $  351.31 

70

72
Simparica Chewable 20 mg 11.1-22.1 lbs 

(10 pk/case)

Simparica Chewable 5 mg 2.5-5.5 lbs (10 

pk/case)

Silver nitrate stix 100 ct/pk

67 Rimadyl 75 mg/tab 180 tabs/bottle

68 Rimadyl 100 mg/tab 180 tabs/bottle

 $  380.63 

Bottles  No Bid  $  - -$   

Bottles No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2GROUP I: Antibotics and Miscellaneous Medication

ANNUAL 

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

 No Bid  $  - -$   

Cases No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

Cases No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

Cases No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

No Bid

No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

Cases  No Bid  $  - -$   

Cases No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

 No Bid  $  - -$   

Bottles  No Bid  $  - -$   

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 8



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

-$   

Bottles  No Bid  $  - -$   

Bottles  No Bid  $  - 

 $  913.50 2,740.50$   

5

25

20

30

Hospira

Vedco

Zoetis

Bidder's 

Brand

10

Bidder's 

Brand

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

30

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Vedco  $  14.00 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Dechra No Bid $  4,739.70 14,219.10$   

Albon Liquid 5% (473 ml bottle) / 16 oz

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE
UNIT PRICE

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

83
ZENIQUIN TABLETS FOR CATS AND 

DOGS, 100 MG - 50 tabs/bottle

80
VINCRISTINE SULFATE INJECTION, 

PRESERVATIVE-FREE, 1 MG/ML

81 Vitamin B12 (injectable bottles)

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

1

 $  185.00 

 $  149.75 

 $  1,156.60 

555.00$   

449.25$   

3,469.80$   

No Bid

No Bid

2 Alcohol 70% Buffered Gallon

GROUP I: Antibotics and Miscellaneous Medication

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE
UNIT PRICE

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

Boxes  No Bid  $  - 

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

78
TRIFECTANT DISINFECTANT POWDER - 10 

lb/bottle
6

Bucket 

Bottle
Generic  $  120.00  $  720.00 2,160.00$   No Bid  No Bid  $  - 

82 Yobine2 mg/ml compound 100 ml/bottle 30 Bottles No Bid  $  -  $  - -$   No Bid  No Bid  $  - 

79 Osurnia Gel for Dogs 20x1 ml

-$   

Bottles  No Bid  $  - -$   

Gallons  $  420.00 1,260.00$   No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

Bottles  No Bid  $  - -$   

-$   

-$   

GROUP II:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2

 $  157.99 

 $  9.25 

 $  5.99 

 $  231.32 No Bid

No BidZoetis  $  91.35 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 9



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

Bandage Scissors large (7.5") Economy

10 Autoclave indicator tape 1"

11

No Bid

No Bid

 $  197.00 

 $  83.93 

591.00$   

251.79$   6

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

AHS

AHS

J0247

J0248A

J0248C

J0249A-V

Generic

Generic

Generic

J0074B

 $  0.92 

 $  1.18 

 $  39.40 

Autoclave indicator strips 10/box

8 Anesthesia bags .5, 1, 2 &3 liter

9
Artifical Tears artificial tears (15 ml liquid 

bottle)

5 Ambu Bags

 $  11.99 

 $  11.99 

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

No Bid $  83.93 

1500 Pieces  $  1,380.00 

7 251.79$   Anesthetic tubes LARGE (Hatrix J0248A)

4 Amber plastic bottle 4 oz

3 Amber plastic bottle 2 oz

Anesthetic tubs SMALL (Hatrix J0248A)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

 $  7.10 

 $  8.29 

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2

GROUP II:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

4,140.00$   No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

1500 Pieces  $  1,770.00 5,310.00$   No Bid  No Bid  $  - -$   

5 Bags  No Bid  $  - -$   

7 Each  No Bid  $  - -$   

7 Each  No Bid  $  - -$   

5 Each  No Bid  $  - -$   

30 Bottles  No Bid  $  - -$   188.10$   

No Bid

No Bid

 $  331.50 

 $  62.70 

 $  66.30 

 $  2.09 

994.50$   

40 Rolls  $  6.11  $  244.40 733.20$   

100 Boxes  $  10.15  $  1,015.00 3,045.00$   

5 Each  No Bid  $  - -$   

852.00$   

2,487.00$   

110.85$   

Crosstex-

sold by the 

case- 18 

rolls/case
Crosstex-

sold by the 

case- 24 

bx/case

No Bid $  7.39 

 $  284.00 

 $  829.00 

 $  36.95 12

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 10



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E)
(3YRS x E = F)

(C) (D) (A x D = E)
(3YRS x E = F)

Boxes  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

20 Boxes  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

19 Cotton cast padding 4" 1 roll/box

21 Elastikon tape 1" 12 roll/box

16

20 Cotton balls large 1000/box

13 Bandage Scissors small 

Cloth Drapes 24" x 24"

17
Cloth Drapes 12" x 18" with 24" 

Fenestration

18
Cloth Drapes 36" x 30" with 26" 

Fenestration

 $         9.50  $          380.00 1,140.00$          No Bid

J1456N  $       10.75  $          430.00 1,290.00$          No Bid

Generic  $       17.50  $          175.00 

14 Charcoal Canister filter

 $          400.00 1,200.00$          No Bid

J1456N

 $       10.00 

40 Each

J0553C  $       13.00  $          780.00 2,340.00$          No Bid

Cliperside  $         6.99 15 Clipper lubricant spary 14 oz

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2GROUP II:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

ANNUAL 

5 Pieces  $            50.86  $          254.30 762.90$            

60 Cans  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

5 Cans  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

40 Each  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

J0074A  $         4.09  $            20.45 61.35$               Hu-Friedy

 $            34.95 104.85$             No Bid

J1456A

 No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

40 Each  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

10 Boxes  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

25 Boxes  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

525.00$             No Bid

Generic  $       24.79  $          619.75 1,859.25$          No Bid

J&J  $       24.99 749.70$             No Bid

J&J  $       25.99  $          519.80 1,559.40$          No Bid22 Elastikon Tape 2" x 2.5 Yds., 6 Rolls/Box

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

 $          249.90 10

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 11



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

No Bid  $             -    $                   -   -$                   Hu-Friedy

 No Bid -$                  Elizabeth collar size 30

1 Each  $            67.28  $            67.28 201.84$            

 No Bid -$                  

No Bid

J0046C  $         3.43  $            68.60 205.80$             No Bid

J0046D  $         4.63  $            92.60 277.80$             No Bid

J0046E  $         5.29  $          105.80 317.40$             No Bid

J0046F  $         6.63  $          132.60 397.80$             No Bid

Andis  $       25.99  $          129.95 389.85$             No Bid

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2

GROUP II:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

5

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

32 Freer Elevator

31 FELV/FIV Text Kits 25/box

29 Elizabeth collar size 25

30

Elizabeth collar size 15

28 Elizabeth collar size 20

24 Elizabeth collar size 7 1/2

23 Electric clipper blade #40

26 Elizabeth collar size 12 1/2

27

25 Elizabeth collar size 10

Blades  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

20 Pieces  $                  -   

20 Pieces  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

20 Pieces  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

20 Pieces  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

J0046A  $         2.14  $            42.80 128.40$             No Bid

J0046B  $         2.49  $            49.80 149.40$             No Bid

J0046G  $         3.39  $            67.80 203.40$             

20 Pieces  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

20 Pieces  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

20 Pieces  $                  -   

100 Boxes  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  Zoetis  $     448.00  $     44,800.00 134,400.00$     No Bid

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 12



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

40 IV catheter 22 gage

41 IV catheter 20 gage

Terumo

39 IV catheter 24 gage

 $         1.36  $            27.20 81.60$               

Crosstex-

sold by the 

case- 50/bx 

- 4bx/case

Terumo  $         1.36  $            27.20 

42 Nail clippers (Andis) 10 Each

Bidder's 

Brand

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

No Bid  $             -    $                   -   -$                   No Bid

Vedco  $       38.00  $       3,800.00 11,400.00$       No Bid

Vedco  $         7.99  $          199.75 599.25$             No Bid

IV fluid line micro drip

36
IV Admin Set (length, drops, # of sites or a 

manufacturer and P/N of what is preferred)

37
IV FluidLine Micro Drip: length, perhaps a 

manufacturer and P/N of what is preferred

J0400A  $         1.49  $          149.00 447.00$             No Bid

J0400A  $         1.49  $            14.90 44.70$               No Bid

J0468MA  $         1.50  $            15.00 45.00$               No Bid38

34 Heartworm Test Kits

35 Hydrogen Peroxide gallon

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

33
Glass Dispensing Jars (2 oz glass dropper 

bottles)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE
UNIT PRICE

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2
GROUP II:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

0 Boxes  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

100 Boxes  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

25 Gallons  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

100 Each  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

10 Each  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

 No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

20 Pieces  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

20 Pieces  $          156.50  $      3,130.00 9,390.00$         

20 Pieces  $          112.38  $      2,247.60 6,742.80$         

Terumo  $         1.36  $            27.20 81.60$               No Bid

81.60$               

Crosstex-

sold by the 

case- 50/bx 

- 4bx/case

10 Pieces

 No Bid  $                  -   -$                  Andis  $         9.25  $            92.50 277.50$             No Bid

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 13



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

UNIT PRICE ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

 $       1,099.00 3,297.00$          

Crosstex-

sold by the 

case- 10 

bx/case

43 Needles 20 gage x 1"

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

 $            12.55  $      1,255.00 3,765.00$         45 Needles 18 gage x 1 1/2" 100 ct/box

Generic  $       10.99  $       1,099.00 3,297.00$          

Crosstex-

sold by the 

case- 10 

bx/case

Generic

Generic  $       10.99  $       1,099.00 3,297.00$          

Crosstex-

sold by the 

case- 10 

bx/case

100 Boxes

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2
GROUP II:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

100 Boxes  $            12.55  $      1,255.00 3,765.00$         

100 Boxes  $            12.55  $      1,255.00 3,765.00$          $       10.99 44 Needles 20 gage x 1 1/2"100 ct/box

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Bidder's 

Brand

46 Oral dosing syringes 10 Pieces Generic  $         0.50  $               5.00 15.00$               No Bid  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

47 Parvo Test Kits 100 Boxes Vedco  $     120.99  $     12,099.00 36,297.00$       No Bid  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

48 Pill cutters 10 Pieces J0696  $         6.00  $            60.00 180.00$             No Bid  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

49 Pill Envelopes 1000/box 3 Boxes Generic  $       30.85  $            92.55 277.65$             No Bid  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

50 Pill counting tray 10 Trays J0697  $       25.00  $          250.00 750.00$             No Bid  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

51 Prescription labels 1000 lab/roll 5 Rolls Vedco  $       19.99  $            99.95 299.85$             No Bid  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

52 Rolled gauze 2" 12 roll/box 5 Boxes Dukal  $         3.38  $            16.90 50.70$               No Bid  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______

DATE:  __9/8/2022_______  2022-0850 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (RE-BID III) 14



Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850
Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Bidder's 

Brand

Each

Dukal  $         6.20  $            31.00 93.00$               

Dukal  $         7.39  $            73.90 221.70$             

J0054SA  $       30.00 

J0054SD  $       30.00  $       2,400.00 7,200.00$          
Hu-Friedy - 

100/bx

Visistat

61
Stethoscope Adult - Labtron Item #602 LB 

or Similar

60

56

25 Cartridge

1

54 Rolled cotton 1 lb/roll

55 Pursuit

UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

53 Rolled gauze 4" 12 roll/box

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

J0553Regeneration

57 Reclaimed Crossing

Sponges 4x4 Non-Woven 4000/case

58 Reflections of the Desert

59  $         8.10  $          405.00 1,215.00$          No Bid

Dukal  $       62.00 

GF Labtron  $       16.00  $            16.00 48.00$               No Bid

 $       12.99  $          324.75 974.25$             

No BidGF Labtron  $       16.00  $            16.00 48.00$               

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

62

 $       2,400.00 7,200.00$          

Radiance

Stethoscope Pediatric - Labtron Item #602 

LB or Similar

No Bid

Visistat  $       12.99  $          324.75 974.25$             No Bid

 $            32.46  $      2,596.80 7,790.40$         

25 Cartridge  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

5 Boxes  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  No Bid

Crosstex-

sold by the 

case- 12 

bx/case
Crosstex-

sold by the 

case- 50/bx 

- 3bx/case

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

 No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2
GROUP II:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

50 Bags  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

36 Cases  $       2,232.00 6,696.00$          Crosstex    $            71.00  $      2,556.00 7,668.00$         

10 Rolls  $            24.66  $          246.60 739.80$            

80 Boxes  $            41.33  $      3,306.40 9,919.20$         

80 Boxes

 No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

1 Each  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______
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Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

Vedco 

U397
 $       61.00  $          610.00 1,830.00$          No Bid

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

 No Bid  $                  -   -$                  
Suture PDS II (polydioxanone) 4/0, 36 

CT/Box (4-0 FS-2 Generic)
72 10 Boxes

38,160.00$       No Bid

Generic  $         6.25 

100 Tubes

80 Cases

69
Surgical gloves Latex PF 4 box/case (size 8 

1/2)

70 Surgical Masks with ear loop 50/box

71 Suture Scissors 4.5

Nutri-Cal  $         8.69 

68
Surgical gloves Latex PF 4 box/case (size 

8)

66
Surgical gloves Latex PF 4 box/case (size 

6)

67
Surgical gloves Latex PF 4 box/case (size 6 

1/2)

64 Supplical 5 oz

65
Surgical scrub brushes (with PVP) 

Disposable

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Generic  $     157.00 

 $          869.00 2,607.00$          

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

97.20$               No Bid

Bidder's 

Brand

J0734  $       63.00  $                   -   -$                   No Bid63

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2
GROUP II:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

0 Boxes  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  Spunbound Bouffant Surgical caps 100/box

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE
UNIT PRICE

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

 No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

10 Each  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

80 Cases  $     12,288.00 36,864.00$        No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

80 Cases  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

Generic  $     153.60 No Bid

Generic  $     155.50  $     12,440.00 37,320.00$       No Bid

No Bid

J0364  $         3.24  $            32.40 

 No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

80 Cases  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

30 Boxes  $              8.85  $          265.50 796.50$            

5 Each  $            56.98  $          284.90 854.70$            

 $          187.50 562.50$             

Crosstex-

sold by the 

case- 40 

bx/case

J0076  $         6.25  $            31.25 93.75$               Hu-Friedy 

 $     12,560.00 37,680.00$       No Bid

Generic  $     159.00  $     12,720.00 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______
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Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F) (C) (D) (A x D = E) (3YRS x E = F)

 $  - -$   

Boxes  $  - -$    No Bid 

 $  9.80  $  490.00 1,470.00$   

Crosstex 

5ml-sold by 

the case-4 

bx of 

Vedco 

923QU
 $  55.99  $  50,391.00 151,173.00$   No Bid

Vedco 

943QU
 $  55.99  $  19,596.50 58,789.50$   No Bid

Vedco 

967QU
 $  61.00  $  6,100.00 18,300.00$   No Bid

EXEL  $  9.99  $  999.00 2,997.00$   No Bid

EXEL

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

AMOUNT

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2
GROUP II:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

75
Suture PDS II (polydioxanone) 0/0 36 

CT/box (0-0 FS-2 Generic)

76
Suture Sorbocryl 4/0 FS-2, 36" 12 CT/box 

NFS-2

79 Suture Sorbocryl 0/0 FS-1, 36" 12 CT/box

80 Syringes 1 mL 21G 100 CT/Box 1" or 5/8"

81 Syringes 3 mL 21G 100 CT/box 1" or 5/8"

82 Syringes 6 mL NO NEEDLE 100 CT/Box

83 Syringes 12 mL NO NEEDLE 100 CT/Box

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

 $  15.25  $  6,862.50 20,587.50$   

Crosstex- 

sold by the 

case-8 

boxes/case

 No Bid 
Vedco 

U451
 $  61.00 No Bid

Vedco 

U468
 $  61.00 No Bid

Vedco 

U467
 $  61.00 

77
Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36" 12 CT/box 

NFS-2

78 Suture Sorbocryl 0/0 FS-1, 36" 12 CT/box

73

 $  22.40  $  672.00 

20 Boxes  $  1,220.00 3,660.00$   

2,016.00$   

No Bid

Vedco 

922QU
 $  55.99  $  1,119.80 3,359.40$   No Bid

Suture PDS II (polydioxanone) 2/0, 36 

CT/box (2-0 FS-2 Generic)

74
Suture PDS II (polydoxanone) 1/0, 36 

CT/box (1-0 FS-2 Generic)

350 Boxes

50 Boxes EXEL

 $  - -$   

20 Boxes  $  1,220.00 3,660.00$    No Bid  $  - -$   

20 Boxes  No Bid  $  - -$   

900 Boxes  No Bid  $  - -$   

 No Bid  $  - -$   

100 Boxes  No Bid  $  - -$   

100 Boxes  No Bid  $  - -$   

450 Boxes  $  19.94  $  8,973.00 26,919.00$   

 $  15.69  $  784.50 2,353.50$   

30 Boxes  $  26.00  $  780.00 2,340.00$   

Crosstex 

10ml-sold by 

the case-2 

bx of 

Generic

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______
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Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

(A) (B) (C) (D) (A x D = E)
(3YRS x E = F)

(C) (D) (A x D = E)
(3YRS x E = F)

10 Boxes Generic  $       21.99  No Bid  $                  -   

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

42.60$               No Bid

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

J01154L

J0075EW

3M/Vedco

Generic

10 Pieces

15

 $            14.20 

89
Urinary Catheter Dog 2.6 mm x 500 mm 

Cvet

90
Urinary Catheter Dog 3.3 mm x 500 mm 

Cvet

96
White Waterproof Tape 2" x 10 yds, 6 

CT/Box

91
Surgical UTILITY SCISSORS, STRAIGHT, 

HEAVY PATTERN, SHARP, BLUNT, 6.5 IN

92 Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 ml/bottle

86 Urinary Catheter Cat 1.3 mm x 130 mm Cvet

87
Urinary Catheter Dog 1.3 mm x 500 mm 

Cvet

88
Urinary Catheter Dog 2.0 mm x 500 mm 

Cvet

84 Tourniquets

93 Vetwrap 2" 18 roll/box

95
White Waterproof Tape 1" x 10 yds, 12 

CT/Box

85 Urinary Catheter Cat 1.0 mm x 130 mm Cvet

 $         2.25 

 $         2.90 

 $       22.80 

 $       18.79 

 $       22.50 

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Hu-Friedy 

No Bid

 $            45.00 135.00$             

 $            45.00 135.00$             

 $            45.00 135.00$             

 $            22.50 67.50$               

 $            22.50 67.50$               

 $            29.00 87.00$               

 $          228.00 684.00$             

 $       5,637.00 

 $          225.00 675.00$             

 $          219.90 659.70$             No Bid

 $         4.50 

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2GROUP II:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ANNUAL 

2 Each  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

ITEM 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 
3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

Bidder's 

Brand
UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED 

J0605  $         7.10 

 No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

10 Pieces  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

10 Pieces  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

10 Pieces  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

J0153M

J0153P

J0153M

J0154S

 $         4.50 

 $         4.50 

 $         2.25 

Boxes Vedco  $       38.00  $          570.00 1,710.00$          No Bid  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

10 Pieces  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

10 Pieces  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

10 Pieces  $            49.08  $          490.80 1,472.40$         

300 Bottles  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  No Bid

J0154M

16,911.00$       

-$                  

10 Boxes  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

15 Boxes Vedco  $       45.00  $          675.00 2,025.00$          No Bid  No Bid  $                  -   -$                  

94 Vetwrap4" 18 roll/box

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______
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Project Name:  Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III) Solicitation #: 2022-0850

Department: Animal Services

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO

EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE 
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL

BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE
SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING 

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

BIDS SOLICITED:     5          LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:    1          BIDS RECEIVED:   2            LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:   1            NO BID:  0

NO OPTION OFFERED

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2022

Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC.

Chicago, IL

2 of 2

El Paso Veterinary Supply

El Paso, TX

1 of 2

Yes YesAMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED:

X x

APPROVED BY: ____/s/______
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Participant Name Response Date Response Status Contact
1 Hu-Friedy Mfg. Co. LLC 08/31/2022 Submitted Cathy Bondi
2 El Paso Veterinary Supply 08/31/2022 Submitted Manuel Talamantes, III
3 DAI Scientific Equipment Inc 08/29/2022 No Bid Lisa Theis
4 Unipak Corp. 08/26/2022 No Bid Brian Marcus
5 Champion Wire & Cable 08/09/2022 No Bid Tina Mcglone
6 Metalcraft Inc. 08/03/2022 No Bid Customer Service
7 Continental Kennel Club Inc. 08/02/2022 No Bid Brandy Roberts
8 Mattingly Low Vision, Inc 07/26/2022 No Bid Elena King
9 Bound Tree Medical, LLC 07/26/2022 No Bid Accounts Receivable
10 365|Health & Fitness (365|III.VI.V. FITNESS, INC.) Viewed Benjamin Mooney
11 Advanced Business Software, LLC. Jonathan Jameson
12 ADVANTAGE OFFICE PRODUCTS LLC STEPHANIE WEGNER
13 advertising Specialties of El Paso Jose Luis Nava
14 AED123 LLC
15 Alight Solutions Greg Hodges
16 American Heart Association, Inc.
17 AMI-DENTAL Joy Chew
18 AMN Allied Services, LLC Seth Mukai
19 Applied Concepts, Inc. Bill Titterington
20 Aquatic Adventures LLC Michael
21 Authentic Promotions.com Peter Carmazzi
22 Avesis Third Party Administrators, LLC Sales Specialist
23 Aztec Contractors Inc Nancy Leanos
24 B&E MEDICAL SUPPLY AND EQUIPMENT, LLC EDWARD VALDEZ
25 Barrera Counseling and Educati Ivonne G Barrera
26 BAY PROMO LLC (baypromo.net) Humberto Arguello
27 Bella Luna Engineering and Building Maintenance Lorenzo Luna
28 Blue Sky Supplies, LLC Michael Barron
29 Bob Barker Company, Inc.
30 borderland services inc carlos adolfo gutierrez
31 CARES MEDICAL CLINIC
32 CareStar, Inc. Waleed Fadayel
33 City of El Paso Strategic Partners The Great Lupe
34 Clinical Pathology Laboratories,Inc Letty Gasca
35 College of American Pathologists Sales Contracting
36 Colliers (New Mexico Real Estate Advisors Inc) Bob Feinberg
37 COLLINS SPORTS MEDICINE
38 Common Threads Linda Flores
39 Con10gency Consulting Norm Voshall
40 CorVel Corporation (CorVel Enterprise Comp Inc) Nicole Ferrera
41 Curascript SD Specialty Distribution (Priority Healthcare Distribution Inc) Michael Fix
42 Denoyer-Geppert Science mary andros
43 Diamond Drugs, Inc. (Diamond Pharmacy Services) Sara Misko
44 Digital Ally, Inc. Nicole Leiker
45 D's Ventures, LLC dba LogMet Solutions DeMaurice "Reese" Scott
46 DUMMIES UNLIMITED INC. TERRA GARCIA
47 Emergence Health Network (El Paso MHMR d/b/a Emergence Health Network)
48 ENDEAVOR DNA LABORATORIES (ENDEAVOR DNA, INC.) DANIEL SLOWINSKI
49 Endeavors (Family Endeavors, Inc) Benjamin Miranda
50 FASTECH CLS, INC. Tim Rawls
51 First Financial Group of America
52 Flotec Inc Brian Davidson
53 Galls, LLC Tiffany Brewer
54 GLOBEX-BURSA INTERNATIONAL TRADE (KEMAL ADLIG) KEMAL ADLIG
55 GN Hearing Care Corporation DBA ReSound Rachel Severson
56 Gracen Engineering & Construction, Inc. Michael Sambrano
57 H.L. Dalis, Inc. Neil S. Howell
58 Hauling Ace Dispatching LLC Shannon (Ace) D Hamilton
59 HeartSafe America, Inc. Mandi Nickerson
60 HemoCue America (HemoCue America, a division of Radiometer America) Alyssa Whitney
61 Henry Schein Medical/EMS
62 Henry Schein, Inc Julia Strange
63 Holiday Inn Express & Suites- Sunland Park Area Danielle Cadena
64 Holt Anatomical, Inc Debra Holt
65 Howdy Resources (CNH Construction LLC) LaVincent Thomas
66 Innovative Claims Strategies Carlos M Navarro
67 INTERBORO PACKAGING CORPORATION Viewed Abraham jeremias
68 Internal Audit Office

2022-0850 Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III)
Online Views



2022-0850 Veterinary Medical Supplies (Re-Bid III)
Online Views

69 Intervet Inc. Merck Animal Health
70 Ironcompany.com, LLC J.P. Brice
71 J&J Enterprises James Davis
72 KMASS Solutions, LLC Keith McGuire
73 LABSOURCE INC STEVEN PLECKI
74 Las Palmas Medical Center Cristi Robles
75 LD Supply Company, Inc. Justin Ellis
76 Liberty Office Products Scott Wiland
77 Life-Assist Inc Cherise Akers
78 Lobo Distribution LLC Perry Wolfe
79 ManhattanLife Daniel Robson
80 McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC
81 Medaserv (Strong Medical Partners LLC) charles fatora
82 Medicaleshop Inc. Abbas Ajmeri
83 Midwest Veterinary Supply Viewed Ali Davis
84 Mission Linen Supply Hector Covarrubias
85 Momar Inc Shaunda Sostand
86 Mpulse Healthcare & Technology
87 Nickes Medical Supply,LLC Grace Chi
88 North America Procurement Council Inc., PBC
89 Olan Group LLC (Lester Olan Hunter) Lester Hunter
90 P.V. Community Development Corporation Bill Schlesinger
91 Patterson Dental Supply, Inc. Viewed
92 Performance Safety Group Drew Allrich
93 PERIKIN Enterprises LLC Rafael Lopez
94 Phitt Consulting LLC Bruce Edmunds
95 Pollock Investments Inc (Pollock Orora) Susan Ritchie
96 Possible Missions, Inc. Paula Mendoza
97 PRIDE Enterprises (Prison Rehabilitative Industries and Diversified Enterprises, Inc.) Mary Jacobs
98 Pro-Action, Inc. (ProAction Emergency Services Institute) Dusty Warden
99 Products Unlimited, Inc.
100 Project Amistad Gerardo Blanco
101 Pulse Supply Chain Solutions SHUBHAM MUKHERJEE
102 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) CANDY ESTES
103 RBM Engineering, Inc. Bryan R. Morris, P.E.
104 Reflective Apparel Becky Keith
105 REPSS, Inc. Dave Thomas
106 Royal Imaging Solutions (Royal Media Network, Inc.) Maricris Bustamante
107 Rx Psychological Services Dr. Jennifer Jaeger Darakjy
108 Safety Vision LLC Monica Marcos
109 Salus Medical Products Sal Russo
110 SAP Referral Services Dawn Dregier
111 School Health Corporation
112 SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC. JEFF GIESEL
113 SI MEDICAL SUPPLY Jamesia McDonald
114 SJI and Associates LLC Gabriel Porras
115 Socorro ISD Samuel Garcia
116 Southwest First Aid and Safety Supply, Inc. Raul Aun
117 Spark Multinational, LLC Horacio Arras
118 Spectrum Paper Maxine Brown-Soto
119 Sunset Survival & First Aid Inc Debbie Depin
120 SYOXSA, Inc. Esteban Trejo
121 TDG Scientific (Taylor Distribution Group, LLC) Artura Taylor
122 Totowa Systems Inc. KAMAL KARAM
123 TrueCare24, Inc. Saleem Mobhani
124 Uweport LLC Unsubmitted Maklin Ryan
125 ValoriHR Minnie (Herminia) Holguin
126 VersaTables John Carlo Manco
127 Vitanya Wellness Center (Strickland Health Products LLC) John E Strickland
128 Wassco Corporation Britt Wasson
129 WellConnect Counseling Inc. (Integrity Employee Assistance) Deborah Ontiveros
130 World of Promotions Layla Rosenfeld
131 WW Grainger Johanna Hunter




