CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

AGENDA DATE: September 27, 2022
PUBLIC HEARING DATE: Not Applicable

CONTACT PERSON(S} NAME AND PHONE NUMBER:
Richard J. Bristol, Streets and Maintenance Director, (915) 212-7000
Claudia A. Garcia, Interim Director of Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing, (915) 212-
1218

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED:  All

STRATEGIC GOAL: No. 7- Enhance and Sustain El Paso’s Infrastructure Network
SUBGOAL.: 7.5 — Set One Standard for Infrastructure Across the City
SUBJECT:

The award of solicitation 2022-0752 OilMWater Separator Services (Re-Bid) to D&H United Fueling Solutions,
Inc. for an initial three (3) year term for an estimated amount of $105,000.00. The award also includes a two (2)
year option for an estimated amount of $70,000.00. The total value of the contract is, including the initial term
plus the option, for a total of five (5) years, for an estimated amount of $175,000.00.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
This contract will allow oil and water separator services for Fleet Services.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on July 19, 2022 and July 26, 2022. The solicitation was posted on City website on
July 19, 2022. There were a total twenty-eight (28) viewers online; three (3) bids were received; one (1) from a
local supplier.

CONTRACT VARIANCE:

The difference based in comparison to the previous contract is as follows: An increase of $60,000.00 for the
initial term, which represents a 133.33% increase due to increased labor costs and an increase in required
services.

PROTEST
No protest received for this requirement.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
N/A

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
Amount: $105,000.00

Funding Source: Internal Service Fund

Account: 532 — 3600 — 531250 — 37020 — P3701

2022-0752 QilfWater Separator Services (Re-Bid)
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HAVE ALL AFFECTED DEPARTMENTS BEEN NOTIFIED? _X__ YES ___NO

PRIMARY DEPARTMENT: Streets and Maintenance
SECONDARY DEPARTMENT: Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing

***m*************REQU I R E D AUTH ORIZATlo N********m*********

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Richard J. Bristol - Sfreets jangMaintefiance Director/”
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COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(LOW BID)
******************************************POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW*******************************************

Please place the following item on the CONSENT agenda for the Council Meeting of September 27, 2022.
STRATEGIC GOAL: NO. 7 — Enhance and Sustain El Paso's Infrastructure Network

The linkage to the Strategic Plan is subsection 7.5 — Set One Standard for Infrastructure Across the City.

Award Summary:

The award of solicitation 2022-0752 Oil/Water Separator Services (Re-Bid) to D&H United Fueling Solutions,
Inc. for an initial three (3) year term for an estimated amount of $105,000.00. The award also includes a two
(2) year option for an estimated amount of $70,000.00. The total value of the contract is, including the initial
term plus the option, for a total of five (5) years, for an estimated amount of $175,000.00. This contract will
allow oil and water separator services for Fleet Services.

Contract Variance:

The difference based in comparison to the previous contract is as follows: An increase of $60,000.00 for the
initial term, which represents a 133.33% increase due to increased labor costs and an increase in required
services.

Department Streets and Maintenance

Vendor D&H United Fueling Solutions, Inc.
San Antonio, TX

Item(s) All

Initial Term 3 Years

Option to Extend 2 Years

Annual Estimated Award $35,000.00

Initial Term Estimated Award  $105,000.00 (3 Years)

Total Estimated Award $175,000.00 (5 Years)

Account Number 532 — 3600 — 531250 — 37020 — P3701

Funding Source Internal Service Fund

District(s) All

This is a Low Bid contract.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing and Streets and Maintenance Departments recommend award as
indicated to D&H United Fueling Solutions, Inc., the lowest, responsible and responsive bidder.

In accordance with this award, the City Manager or designee is authorized to exercise future options if needed.

*******************************************ADDITIONAL INFO BELOW**********************************************



CITY OF EL PASO ol

BID TABULATION FORM it
Winner
Project Name: Oil/ Water Separator Services (Re-Bid) Solicitation #: 2022-0752
Bid Opening Date: August 17, 2022 Department: Streets and Maintenance
D&H United Fueling Solutions, Inc. Heritage-Cystal Clean, LLC Safety-Kleen Systems
San Antonio, TX Elgin, IL El Paso, TX
Bidder 1 of 3 Bidder 2 of 3 Bidder 3 of 3
ILIiM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 |Sump Cleaning / Vac Services Fee (Per Gallon) $ 1.50( $ 1.59( $ 1.72
2 |Fuel Surcharge (Per Visit) $ 40.00] $ 95.00( $ 180.00
3 |Vacuum Truck Fee (Per Visit) $ 150.00( $ 275.00( $ 287.00
TOTAL $ 191.50( $ 371.59( $ 468.72

Is/

APPROVED BY:

pate: _08/24/22 2022-0752 OIL/WATER SEPARATOR SERVICES (RE-BID) 1




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: Oil/ Water Separator Services (Re-Bid)

Bid Opening Date: August 17, 2022

A Achicvement of

2022
Award
Winner

dipi

L, L

Solicitation #: 2022-0752

Department: Streets and Maintenance

D&H United Fueling Solutions, Inc.
San Antonio, TX

Heritage-Cystal Clean, LLC
Elgin, IL

Safety-Kleen Systems
El Paso, TX

Bidder 1 of 3

Bidder 2 of 3

Bidder 3 of 3

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE
AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY)|
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE
TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF
THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS
AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY|
EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION|
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED

AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED:

N/A

N/A

N/A

BIDS SOLICITED: 279 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 116

BIDS RECEIVED: 3

LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 1

NO BID: 10

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVEDBY: _ IS/

pate: 08/24/22

2022-0752 OIL/WATER SEPARATOR SERVICES (RE-BID)




2022-0752 Oil/Water Separator Services (Re-Bid)
Bidder's List

Participant Name

1 300 EXTERMINATOR TERMITE AND PEST CONTROL, LLC

2 AARON NEVAREZ
3 ABBA CONSTRUCTION, LLC
4 Ace Government Services LLC
5 AD Towing & Recovery (AD Wrecker Service, Inc)
6 Advance Auto Parts (Advance Stores Company, Inc.)
7 ADVANTAGE OFFICE PRODUCTS LLC
8 AGDL International LLC (Self)
9 Alamo Auto Supply (Alamo Industries, Inc.)
10 All Terrain Mobile Car Wash & Detailing LLC
11 Allied Paving
12 Alon Brands, Inc.
13 ALS Global
14 Altro
15 Amaru Motors 3 LLC dba Charlie Clark Nissan El Paso
16 American Tire Distributors
17 Amtek USA, Austin
18 APEX TOWING & TRANSPORT
19 APFELBAUM INDUSTRIAL, INC.
20 Aquatic Adventures LLC
21 Arcadis U.S., Inc.
22 Archer Energy Solutions
23 Arete Engineering, LLC
24 ARI-Hetra (ARI Phoenix, Inc.)
25 ASAP Security Services
26 Atlantic Diving Supply, Inc.
27 ATS Inc (Advanced Transportation Services Inc)
28 Auto-Chlor System
29 Aztec Contractors Inc
30 BARBARA TECHNOLOGIES CORPORATION
31 Batteriesplusbulbs442 (Gorman Batteries LLC)
32 Bella Luna Engineering and Building Maintenance
33 Bill Williams Tire Center
34 Bio Dyne Chemical Co. (MJ Mader Enterprises Inc.)
35 Bitimec International Inc
36 Blackstone Security Services, Inc. of Texas
37 Blue Sky's the Limit, LLC
38 Bob Barker Company, Inc.
39 Border International Trucks (RJ Border International)
40 Border Tire
41 borderland services inc
42 Bound Tree Medical, LLC

43 Bright Growing Landscape and Maintenance (Guma Services, LLC)

44 Burke Insurance Group (Risk Strategies Company)
45 Burns & McDonnell Engineering Company, Inc.
46 Burton Enterprises LLC

47 Busch Systems International Inc.

48 C & L Janitorial Services

49 C&R Distributing

50 Casa Ford

51 Cascade Fire Equipment Company

52 Central Auto Supply Inc

53 Champion Wire & Cable

54 Chato's Quarter Horses & Alfalfa Hay Sales

55 City of El Paso Strategic Partners

56 CMC Agronomy (CMC Agronomy LLC)

57 CMC Government Supply (CMC Government Services Inc)
58 Coach USA (Carrion)

59 Coastal Welding Supply, Inc.

60 Colliers (New Mexico Real Estate Advisors Inc)
61 Colonial Oil Industries, Inc.

62 CompStat Holdings LLC

63 Computers Plus Repair Center

64 Con10gency Consulting

65 Construction Journal

66 Construction Reporter

67 Continental Kennel Club Inc.

68 Controllix Corporation

69 Copper State Bolt & Nut

70 Coretech

71 Cummins Sales and Service (Cummins Inc)

72 D&H United Fueling Solutions

73 DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT

74 David Ward Inc (Clinic)

75 Delgado’s Repair and Maintenance

76 Delta Fire & Safety Inc.

77 Delta Pest Control & Lawn Service (Delta Unlimited LLc)
78 Denoyer-Geppert Science

Viewed

Viewed

08/11/2022 No Bid

Viewed

07/19/2022 No Bid

Viewed
08/09/2022 No Bid

07/20/2022 No Bid

Unsubmitted

Viewed

Viewed
08/02/2022 No Bid

08/16/2022 Submitted

Response D Response Statu Contact

Aaron A. Amaya

CHARLIE FLORES
Steven Chapel
Monica Dominguez
Shari Vergara

STEPHANIE WEGNER
Jorge Ignacio Angulo

Richard Krasne

Sonja Scanlan
Sonia West
doug studer

Angela Jinkins
Kaylan Wardlaw

Bertha Munoz
Michael

Rick Tonole
Eliseo Tapia
Tekla Goodwin
Noemi McDonald
Shannon Hubbard
Abraham Wardy
Jonah Beckstead
Nancy Leanos

C E B. SPAUR
Charlie Norton
Lorenzo Luna
Chris Rogers
Michael Mader
Christian Murillo
Raul De Leon
Todd Stevenson

Alex Minjares
Julio Chacon

carlos adolfo gutierrez
Accounts Receivable

Alex Guadarrama
Will Burke

Scott Pasternak
Debra Burton
Michaela Nagy
Cesar g pere
Keith Kirkpatrick
Sergio Garcia
Donald Lloyd

Tina Mcglone

Luis Gutierrez
The Great Lupe
tim cuquet mitchell
Customer Service

Rachel Wilson
Bob Feinberg

Michael Anaya
Manuel Quintero
Norm Voshall
Pamela Exton
Rebecca Taylor
Brandy Roberts
Cynthia Burry

Juan Velez
Darrin Mellinger
Steve Teran
Garrett Dobmeier
David Ward
Alberto Delgado

Bertha A. Pinney
mary andros



2022-0752 Oil/Water Separator Services (Re-Bid)

79 Diamond Business Services, Inc  ASI# 550053
80 DILAX Systems US

81 Discount Banners and Signs Inc

82 Discount Two-Way Radio Corporation

83 Diverging Approach Incorporated

84 Diversity Security Services (Michael Malone)
85 DRC Emergency Services

86 DUMMIES UNLIMITED INC.

87 Dunn-Edwards Corportation

88 EARLE KINLAW AND ASSO., INC. dba EKA
89 EBCO Inc.

90 Efficio Construction Services LLC

Bidder's List

91 EL PASO CASTERS & MATERIAL HANDLING (CASTERS UNLIMITE

92 El Paso Disposal, LP

93 EL PASO METALS & SUPPLY,INC
94 el paso trench safety inc

95 EL PASO-PHOENIX PUMPS INC

96 ENDEAVOR DNA LABORATORIES (ENDEAVOR DNA, INC.)

97 Enviromaster (Afja)
98 Epoxy Design Systems, Inc.
99 EPTEX Coatings
100 ERMC Aviation Services
101 ESSCO Environmental, Inc.
102 Ewing Irrigation
103 FAAC Incorporated
104 FAR WEST SERVICES INC
105 Ferrellgas, LP
106 Fireblast Global
107 Flinn Scientific, Inc
108 Foray Technologies (Foray, LLC)
109 Ford Motor
110 Freedom environmental group
111 Fuels LLC
112 G T DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
113 Galls, LLC
114 Garrison Minerals
115 Giant Electrical Services
116 Global Containers & Custom Packaging Inc.
117 GLOBAL SALES AND SERVICE
118 GLOBAL SUPPLY & SERVICE INC.

119 GLOBEX-BURSA INTERNATIONAL TRADE (KEMAL ADLIG)

120 Gracen Engineering & Construction, Inc.

121 Graybar electric

122 Hackett Security, Inc. (DBA Alton Burglar Alarm)
123 Haix North America

124 Hammer Performance

125 HAUL LINE, INC.

126 Hauling Ace Dispatching LLC

127 Haworth and Associates, Inc

128 HDR Engineering, Inc.

129 HeartSafe America, Inc.

130 Heritage-Crystal Clean, LLC (Heritage-Crystal Clean, Inc.)

131 Hi-Line Electric Co. Inc (Hi-Line, Inc)

132 HITEQ COMPUTER SYSTEMS (PROLEAF CORPORATION)

133 Holiday Inn Express & Suites- Sunland Park Area
134 Holzberg Communications, Inc.

135 Howdy Resources (CNH Construction LLC)
136 IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts
137 Industrial Disposal Supply CO, LLC

138 INTEGRATED MECHANICS, LLC

139 INTERBORO PACKAGING CORPORATION
140 Internal Audit Office

141 1QP CANOPIES LLC.

142 Kimball Midwest (Midwest Motor Supply Co. Inc.)
143 Kimley-Horn and Associates, Inc.

144 KMASS Solutions, LLC

145 La Estrella Hosiery

146 LABSOURCE INC

147 LD Supply Company, Inc.

148 Liberty Office Products

149 Life Ambulance Service, Inc.

150 Life Landscaping

151 Lighting Resources LLC

152 Li-Neon Media Group

153 Lion TotalCare

154 Liquid Environmental Solutions of Georgia, LLC
155 Lobo Distribution LLC

156 LOPEZ SCRAP METAL, INC.

157 Lowntro LP dba Roy Lown's Classic Awards and Billiards

158 MALLORY SAFETY & SUPPLY

Viewed

08/03/2022 No Bid

08/17/2022 Submitted

Viewed

Charlia Pence
meliton chaidez
Amy Hardy

Stoyan Varbanov
Matthew Henderson
Michael Malone
Lisa Walsh

TERRA GARCIA
Adolfo Quintero
Cindy Kister

Ed Buttimore

Juan Villalobos
David Sanchez
Lorena Quezada
sandra

Louis Cepeda Jr
Mike Beltran
DANIEL SLOWINSKI
Mina ordonez

Hank Taylor
Enrique Payan
MICHAEL CROWLEY
Emile G. Couroux
Ken Futrell

Tom Neels

Joe Gonzalez
Sally Lovell

Willie Jenkins
Michelle Tucker

Tiffany Brewer

Juan Martinez
Jose Ochoa
Alfredo Medrano
DAVID SANCHEZ
KEMAL ADLIG
Michael Sambrano
Fred Melendez
Bob Williams
Lindsay Rose

Rick Gomez
Shannon (Ace) D Hamilton

Mandi Nickerson

Accounts Receivable Dept.

Terry Kimbell

Adil Gaziani
Danielle Cadena
Andy Holzberg
LaVincent Thomas

Jeanette Austin
JAVIER RODRIGUEZ
Abraham jeremias

Ruben Espino
Colin Statler

Keith McGuire
Gerardo Rivera
STEVEN PLECKI
Justin Ellis

Scott Wiland

Rachel Harracksingh

Kari Porter

Chris Hobbs
Accounts Receivable
Perry Wolfe

Isidro Lopez

Norma Mendoza

Lily Rees



2022-0752 Oil/Water Separator Services (Re-Bid)

Bidder's List

159 Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville

160 Marrs Embroidery and Screen Printing Inc

161 Matco Tools (Matco Tools Corporation)

162 Mayfield Pool Supply, LP

163 McNeilus (McNeilus Financial, Inc.)

164 Mean Clean LLC

165 Metalcraft Inc.

166 Metro Fire Apparatus Specialists, Inc.

167 MHQ of New Mexico (Don Chalmers Ford)

168 MILESTONE HYDRAULICS (MILESTONE INDUSTRIAL, INC.)
169 Mirador Enterprises, Inc. (Mirador Enterprises)

170 Mission Communications LLC

171 Mission Critical Partners, LLC

172 Mission Linen Supply

173 mobility products of el paso

174 Mohawk Mfg. & Supply Co.

175 Momar Inc

176 Muncie Transit Supply (Muncie Reclamation and Supply)
177 Nan McKay and Associates

178 NFI Parts (The Aftermarket Parts Company, LLC)

179 Nickes Medical Supply,LLC

180 NorrisLeal, LLC

181 North America Procurement Council Inc., PBC

182 North America Security Service (L&J Staffing Co)

183 Olan Group LLC (Lester Olan Hunter)

184 O'Reilly Auto Parts (O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC)

185 Otto Environmental Systems North America, Inc.

186 P&V Distributing

187 P&Y Pump Service (P&Y Mobile Wash Inc)

188 Pannell Industries Inc

189 Performance Safety Group

190 Performance Tool & Equipment, Inc.

191 Petroleum Traders Corporation

192 Pollock Investments Inc (Pollock Orora)

193 Possible Missions, Inc.

194 Precision MPI (MPI Machinery and Design LLC)

195 PREMIER UNIFORMS & TACTICAL SUPPLY (AH ENTERPRISES IN
196 Pro-Action, Inc. (ProAction Emergency Services Institute)
197 PROCON JCB

198 Professional Service Industries, Inc.

199 Project Amistad

200 Pronto Body Shop

201 Prudential Overall Supply

202 Prudential Security Inc

203 PSI BEARING AND HYDRAULIC SERVICE LLC.

204 Quality Vans & Specialty Vehicles (J.A.R Capital Group, Inc.)
205 RAD Painting (Ricardo DeLucio)

206 Range USA (Topco America, LLC)

207 Reflective Apparel

208 Rehrig Pacific Company

209 RENT A TRAILER LLC (Carlos Fraire)

210 Rentokil North America, Inc. (Target Specialty Products)
211 REPSS, Inc.

212 RH Industries

213 Roger Brown Co. LLC

214 Romaine Electric Corporation

215 Royal Imaging Solutions (Royal Media Network, Inc.)
216 S.S.P.Inc

217 Saenz Material & Handling of El Paso Inc

218 Safety Vision LLC

219 Safety-Kleen

220 Sam Packs Five Star Ford

221 Santa Teresa Motorsports (Logston & Logston Inc)

222 SAP Referral Services

223 Sarabia's Portable Jons & Blue Sanitation (El Paso Sanitation Systems
224 SATEC Inc

225 Scotwood Industries, LLC

226 Sheng Engineering PLLC

227 Siddons Martin Emergency Group, LLC

228 Sierra Machinery, Inc.

229 Silsbee Ford

230 Simpson Norton Corporation

231 Sirchie Acquisition Company, LLC

232 SJl and Associates LLC

233 Socorro ISD

234 Southern Counties Oil Co., a CA Limited Partnership dba SC Fuels
235 Southwest Premier Services, LLC

236 Southwestern Industrial

237 Spartan Construction of TX, Inc.

238 Spectrum Paper

08/04/2022 No Bid

08/03/2022 No Bid

07/22/2022 No Bid

Viewed

07/19/2022 No Bid

Viewed

08/17/2022 Submitted

Dan Luther

Sandra Martnez/Rita Guzman

Tim Rizzo
John Plowman

Customer Service
Jayme Farmer
John Granger
James Guerra
Adriana Dominguez
KEN SCOTT

Judy Treaster
Hector Covarrubias
eric green

Chelsea Campbell
Shaunda Sostand
Becky Huff

Angela Cao
Amabel Asidao
Grace Chi

Ruben Moncayo

Joe Marion
Lester Hunter

Mark Bath

Pamela E Caraveo
Peter Pedregom
Rachel Zhang
Drew Allrich

Alex Martinez
Gayle Newton
Susan Ritchie
Paula Mendoza

Alexandra Perez/Miguel Perez

Norma Navarette
Dusty Warden
Amanda Ormseth
John Cordova
Gerardo Blanco
Tiffany Menefee
Tiffany Medina
Ray Borchard
Juan J Cabral

Ric DeLucio
Jim Rodriguez
Becky Keith
Josh Tubbs
Carlos Fraire
Steve McClung
Dave Thomas

Raymundo Hernandez

Dale Betz
Casey Haskin
Maricris Bustamante
John Davies
Leo Rodriguez
Monica Marcos
Ryan Clark
Alan Rosner
Lori Soto
Dawn Dregier
Lorena Soto
Juan Diaz
Kara Banks
Zhuping Sheng

Adria Ayon
RICHARD HYDER
Shelly Spencer
Dan Oneil

Gabriel Porras
Samuel Garcia
Karen Koep

Jaime Anchondo
Vincent Cabral
Steve Allen
Maxine Brown-Soto



2022-0752 Oil/Water Separator Services (Re-Bid)

Bidder's List

239 Stanley Spring and Suspension

240 State Industrial Products

241 Stertil-Koni USA, Inc.

242 Stewart & Stevenson Power Products LLC

243 Stiles General Contractors LLC

244 Stylecraft Inc

245 SUN CITY ANALYTICAL, INC.

246 SUN CITY SECURITY SERVICE INC. Viewed
247 Sunbelt Rentals, Inc

248 Sunset Brokers LLC

249 Sunset Survival & First Aid Inc

250 SYOXSA, Inc.

251 TELSUPPLIERS LLC

252 Texas Alternator Starter Service (The McAdams Group, LLC)
253 Texoma MFG

254 The Culinary Factory

255 The Movers of El Paso (Leonardo Urrutia)

256 The Planlt Room Viewed
257 Tidal Basin Government Consulting, LLC

258 Toter, LLC

259 Totowa Systems Inc.

260 Traffic control specialists (Leedsmann Construction Inc.)

261 TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.

262 Triad Marine

263 TruckPro, LLC (TruckPro Holding Corporation) Viewed
264 Unipak Corp.

265 Univar Solutions USA Inc.

266 Urban Restoration Group U.S. Inc.

267 vehicle maintenance program

268 Versalift Southwest, L.L.C.

269 VersaTables

270 Vets Securing America, Inc (Vets Securing America)

271 Vision Ford Lincoln (Vision Ford Lincoln, Inc.)

272 Viva Powersports Viewed
273 wesco distribution

274 Whoop Wireless

275 Wilsons Hotshot Services LLC

276 Wood Environment & Infrastrucure Solutions, Inc.

277 WW Grainger

278 www.jhdavidson.com

279 Ysleta ISD

Stanley Munro

Accounts Receivable
Kellie Boehm

Jorge Ruiz

Adeliz Stiles

Pamela Pavao

Luis Acuna

Norma | Guzman Kennedy
Dan Newby

Jamel Clary

Debbie Depin

Esteban Trejo

GEORGE TANCREDI
Joel McAdams

Scott Crain

Alexandra Worthington
LEONARDO L URRUTIA
Cecilia Hernandez

Kellie Clark

KAMAL KARAM
Amanda Ledesma
MONIQUE DASILVA
Tina Miller

Buddy Saulsbury
Brian Marcus

Roise Holiday
Accounts

Jeffrey drews

John Carlo Manco
Nagah Abdelshahid
VISION FORD LINCOLN
Junior Urbina
Martin Duran

Mark Strittmatter
Kevin Wilson
Jamie Barnes
Johanna Hunter
Tyler J. Davidson





