CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

AGENDA DATE: May 7, 2024
PUBLIC HEARING DATE: Not Applicable

CONTACT PERSON(S) NAME AND PHONE NUMBER:
Peter Pacillas, Chief of Police (915) 494-7384
K. Nicole Cote, Managing Director, (915) 212-1092

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All

STRATEGIC GOAL: No. 2 Set the Standard for a Safe and Secure City
SUBGOAL: 2.1 Maintain standing as one of the nation’s top safest cities
SUBJECT:

Discussion and action on the award of solicitation No. 2024-0117 to Police Uniforms Bazaar Uniforms and Men's
Store LLC, for an initial three (3) year term for an estimated amount of $957,000.00. The award also includes a one
(1), two (2) year option for an estimated amount of $638,000.00. The total contract value is, including the initial term
plus the option, for a total estimated amount of $1,595,000.00.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
This contract is to provide uniforms for the City of El Paso Police Department.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on October 31, 2023 and November 7, 2023. The solicitation was posted on City website
on October 31, 2023. There was a total of seventeen (17) viewers online; two (2) bids were received, two (2) being
local suppliers.

CONTRACT VARIANCE:
The difference based in comparison to the previous contract is as follows: An increase of $595,000.00; which
represents a 59.50% increase due to increased pricing and the addition the Code Enforcement Unit..

PROTEST
No protest was received for this requirement.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
N/A

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
Amount: $1,595,000.00
Funding: General Fund

Account: 531200-321-1000-21090

HAVE ALL AFFECTED DEPARTMENTS BEEN NOTIFIED? _X_YES _NO
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PRIMARY DEPARTMENT: Police Department
SECONDARY DEPARTMENT: Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing

*****************f*REQUIRED T ORIZATlo N********************
DEPARTMENT HEAD: 7 Tl

Exec. A/C Victor Zarur #1515
#7292 #

Peter Pacillas, Police Chief
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Project Form
Low Bid
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Posting Language Below

Please place the following item on the Regular Agenda for the City Council of May 7, 2024.
Strategic Goal 2 - Set the Standard for a Safe and Secure City

The linkage to the Strategic Plan is subsection: 2.1 Maintain standing as one of the nation’s top
safest cities

Award Summary:

Discussion and action on the award of solicitation 2024-0117 Police Uniforms to Bazaar Uniforms
and Men'’s Store LLC for an initial term of three (3) years for an estimated amount of $957,000.00.
The award also includes a two (2) year option for an estimated amount of $638,000.00. The total
contract time is for five (5) years for a total estimated amount of $1,595,000.00. This contract will
replenish uniforms for the City of El Paso Police Department.

Contract Variance:

The difference based in comparison to the previous contract is as follows: An increase of
$595,000.00; which represents a 59.50% increase due to increased pricing and the addition
of Code Enforcement Unit.

Department: Police Department

Award to: Bazaar Uniforms and Men’s Store LLC.
City & State: El Paso, TX

ltem(s):

Initial Term: 3 Years

Option Term: 2 Years

Total Contract Time: 5 Years

Annual Estimated Award: $319,000.00

Initial Term Estimated Award:  $957,000.00
Option Term Estimated Award:  $638,000.00

Total Estimated Award $1,595,000.00

Account(s) 531200 — 321 - 1000 — 21090
Funding Source(s): General Fund

District(s): All Districts

This was a Low Bid Procurement - catalog contract.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing Department and Police Department recommend award as
indicated to Bazaar Uniforms and Men'’s Store LLC the lowest responsive and responsible bidder.

It is requested that the City Manager be authorized to establish the funding sources and make
any necessary budget transfers and execute any and all documents necessary for execution of
this award.

In accordance with this award, the City Manager or designee is authorized to exercise future
options if needed.
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No.

2024-0117 Police Uniforms
Viewers List

Participant Name
1 G T DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

2 Code 10 Gear
3 Bazaar Uniforms and Men's Store LLC
4 Paso-Tex Industries LLC
5 To The Hilt Security (idrive-huffman LLC)
6 Mattingly Low Vision, Inc
7 Knight Observations
8 Spark Multinational, LLC
9 GYC Work Wear & Uniforms
10 Promo Solutions
11 North America Procurement Council Inc., PBC
12 CONDOR OUTDOOR PRODUCTS, INC
13 Galls, LLC
14 Unipak Corp.
15 B-52 Tactical Gear
16 Alamo Shooters Supply & Uniform
17 Premier Uniforms & Tactical Supply

Response Status
Viewed

Submitted
Submitted
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Viewed
Viewed
No Bid
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Unsubmitted
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

City
AUSTIN

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

el paso

El Paso

El Paso

El Paso

Fort Worth
Frisco
Grand Junction
IRWINDALE
Lexington

West Long Branch

El Paso
El Paso
El Paso

CO
CA
KY
NJ

X
X
TX



